BID TABULATION
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Project Name: Brown & Root Industrial Services, LLC Project Mgr: Bill Edwards PROPOSED
Facility Building 25 Renovations, Rosecrans Air Nat{ Consultant: Ellison-Auxier Architects, Inc. SUBCONTRACTORS
City: St. Joseph Contract Spec. Mandy Roberson A. [Flooring Contractor
Project No.: T2407-01 Bid Date:] 9/5/2024 B. |Electrical Contractor
C.
This includes preliminary and incomplete evaluation criteria, no conclusions should be inferred from this information alone. D.
Award will be made to the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder whose bid is within the available funds for the project. E.
The Director reserves the right to waive informalities in bid submittals and to reject any or all bids. F.
G.
NAME OF BIDDING FIRM BASE BID ALTERNATE 1 ALTERNATE 2 ALTERNATE 3 ALTERNATE 4
A. DB Flooring dba Regents Flog
B. |KC Electrical
Brown & Root Industrial Services, $ 324,203.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 130,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 (C.
D.
$329,203.00 $459,203.00 $484,203.00 $524,203.00 E.
F.
G.
A. [Interior Surfaces
B. |R/S Electrical
E.L. Crawford Construction, Inc. $ 219,912.00 | $ 5,995.00 | $ 129,229.00 | $ 48,686.00 | $ 22,200.00 |C.
D.
$225,907.00 $355,136.00 $403,822.00 $426,022.00 E.
Awarded Contractor, Base Bid, Alternate #1 and #2 7.
G.
A.
B.
Gibbs Masonry $ 35,051.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |C.
D.
E.
F.
G.
A. [Eckards Home Improvement
B. |R/S Electric
Lawhon Construction Company $ 210,800.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 113,500.00 | $ 27,800.00 | $ 26,100.00 (C.
D.
$212,750.00 $326,250.00 $354,050.00 $380,150.00 E.
F.
G.
A. [Eckards/Commercial Surfaces
B. |R/S Electric
Lee Grover Construction Company | $ 206,581.00 | $ 1,898.00 | $ 186,375.00 | $ 28,094.00 | $ 20,931.00 |C.
D.
$208,479.00 $394,854.00 $422,948.00 $443,879.00 E.
F.
G.
A. [Commercial Surfaces
B. |R/S Electric Corp.
Lehr Construction Company $ 250,877.00 | $ 2,219.00 | $ 129,159.00 | $ 42,018.00 | $ 20,898.00 (C.
D.
$253,096.00 $382,255.00 $424,273.00 $445,171.00 E.
F.
G.




