REPLACE FIRE ALARM PANELS, MULTIPLE ASSETS

WESTERN RECEPTION AND DIAGNOSTIC

CORRECTIONAL CENTER
(ST. JOSEPH, MISSOURI)

FSC INC

\ ENGINEERS, LLC )

8675 West 96th Street
Overland Park, KS 66212
Phone: 816.333.4373
Fax: 913.722.3484
OWNER: STATE OF MISSOURI DESIGNER: FSC Inc
MIKE KEHOE, GOVERNOR

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

PROJECT NUMBER: (C2325-01
PROJECT: OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATION

MANAGEMENT: DIVISION OF FACILITIES MANAGEMENT, SITE NUMBER: 7012
DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION ASSET NUMBER: 9327012063

SHEET 1 of 61
FA-000
05/14/2025



WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CENTER

ST. JOSEPH, MISSOURI

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING - PARK
BUILDING
CENTER
BUILDING &
POWERHOUSE

BUCHANAN
BUILDING

| LAUNDRY
ﬂ/ BUILDING
B PROPERTY
| STORAGE
| BUILDING

\EDUCATION

BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

1 SITE PLAN

SCALE: N/A

AN
T

SHEET INDEX

NO. SHEET SHEET NAME
NO.
1 FA-000 COVER SHEET
2 FA-001 FIRE ALARM SITE PLAN
3 FA-002 FIRE ALARM GENERAL NOTES
4 FA-003 FIRE ALARM SCHEMATIC RISER DIAGRAM
5 FA-004 TYPICAL EQUIPMENT MOUNTING GUIDELINES
6 FA-100 ADMIN BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
7 FA-100-1 ADMIN BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
8 FA-100-2 ADMIN BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
9 FA-100-3 ADMIN BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-3
10 FA-101 ADMIN BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
11 FA-101-1 ADMIN BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
12 | FA-101-2 ADMIN BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
13 FA101-3 ADMIN BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-3
14 FA101-4 ADMIN BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR MEZZANINE FIRE ALARM PLAN
15 FA-102 ADMIN BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
16 FA-102-1 ADMIN BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
17 | FA-102-2 ADMIN BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
18 | FA-102-3 ADMIN BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-3
19 FA-103-1 ADMIN BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR & PENTHOUSE FIRE ALARM PLAN
20 | FA-103-2 ADMIN BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR MEZZANINE FIRE ALARM PLAN
21 FA-200-1 BUCHANAN BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
22 | FA-200-2 BUCHANAN BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
23 | FA-201-1 BUCHANAN BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
24 FA201-2 BUCHANAN BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
25 | FA-202-1 BUCHANAN BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
26 | FA-202-2 BUCHANAN BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
27 | FA-300-1 CENTER BUILDING - BASEMENT FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
28 | FA-300-2 CENTER BUILDING - BASEMENT FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
29 | FA-301-1 CENTER BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
30 | FA-301-2 CENTER BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
31 FA-302-1 CENTER BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
32 | FA-302-2 CENTER BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
33 FA-303-1 CENTER BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
34 | FA-303-2 CENTER BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
35 | FA-304-1 CENTER BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
36 | FA-304-2 CENTER BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
37 FA-305-1 POWER HOUSE - BASEMENT & FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
38 | FA-305-2 POWER HOUSE - SECOND FLOOR & CAT WALK FIRE ALARM PLAN
39 FA-400 ILS BUILDING - BASEMENT & FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
40 FA-401 ILS BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
41 FA-402 ILS BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR & ATTIC FIRE ALARM PLAN
42 FA-500 MAINTENANCE BUILDING - FIRE ALARM PLAN
43 FA-600 PARK BUILDING - BASEMENT & FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
44 | FA-600-1 PARK BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
45 | FA-600-2 PARK BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
46 FA-601 PARK BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
47 | FA-601-1 PARK BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
48 | FA-601-2 PARK BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
49 FA-602 PARK BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
50 FA-602-1 PARK BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
51 | FA-602-2 PARK BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
52 FA-603 PARK BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
53 FA-603-1 PARK BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
54 | FA-603-2 PARK BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
55 FA-604 PARK BUILDING - FIFTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
56 FA-604-1 PARK BUILDING - FIFTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
57 | FA-604-2 PARK BUILDING - FIFTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
58 FA-700 LAUNDRY BUILDING - FIRE ALARM PLAN
59 FA-800 EDUCATION BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
60 FA-801 EDUCATION BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN
61 FA-900 PROPERTY STORAGE BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN

LIST OF BUILDINGS WITHIN LIST OF BUILDING NOT INCLUDED IN

THE SCOPE OF WORK: THE SCOPE OF WORK:

ADMIN BUILDING 10 HOUSE STORAGE SHED 2 HOUSE

BUCHANAN BUILDING 11 HOUSE UNOCCUPIED/CONDEMNED 3 HOUSE

CENTER BUILDING 06 HOUSE EQUIPMENT SHED 4 HOUSE

ILS BUILDING 101 HOUSE COLD STORAGE 5 HOUSE

MAINTENANCE BUILDING 100 HOUSE TRAINING 13 HOUSE
PARK BUILDING 01 HOUSE GUARD TOWER 14 HOUSE
LAUNDRY BUILDING 07 HOUSE CAR WASH 112 HOUSE
EDUCATION BUILDING 09 HOUSE CERT CENTER 113 HOUSE
PROPERTY STORAGE BUILDING 08 HOUSE

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

J

.

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

FIRE ALARM SITE
PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-001

2 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



GENERAL NOTES

1.

ALL NOTES ON THIS DRAWING ARE AN INTEGRAL PART OF
THE CONTRACT DOCUMENT AND MUST BE READ IN
CONJUNCTION WITH ALL PACKAGE ELEMENTS
(SPECIFICATIONS, LAYOUTS,...ETC)

ALL WORK SHALL BE DESIGNED, INSTALLED, AND TESTED IN
COMPLIANCE WITH THE CODES, STANDARDS, AND
AMENDMENTS ADOPTED BY THE STATE OF MISSOURI AND
THE CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. IN ADDITION TO THE NOTED
CODES AND STANDARDS PER THE IEBC §701.2 NO
MODIFICATION SHALL BE MADE TO SUCH THAT THE
BUILDING BECOMES LESS SAFE THAN THE EXISTING
CONDITIONS AND THE ORIGINAL INTENT OF THE FIRE ALARM
SYSTEM.
a. 2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
b. 2018 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
c.  OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH ACT (OSHA)
d.  NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION ASSOCIATION
e 2023 NFPA 70 - NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE
e 2022 NFPA 72 — NATIONAL FIRE ALARM AND
SIGNALING CODE
e. UL LISTINGS
e UL STANDARD 864 — STANDARD FOR CONTROL
UNITS AND ACCESSORIES FOR FIRE ALARM
SYSTEMS
e UL STANDARD 268 — STANDARD FOR SMOKE
DETECTORS FOR FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS
e UL 38-STANDARD FOR MANUALLY ACTUATED
SIGNALING BOXES FOR USE WITH
FIRE-PROTECTIVE SIGNALING SYSTEMS.
e UL 521-HEAT DETECTORS FOR FIRE
PROTECTIVE SIGNALING SYSTEMS
e UL 464 - AUDIBLE SIGNALING DEVICES
e UL 1971 -VISUAL SIGNALING APPLIANCES
(STROBES) FOR HEARING IMPAIRED.

INSTALLING CONTRACTOR QUALIFICATIONS

3.

4.

BID

THE INSTALLING CONTRACTING COMPANY SHALL BE U.L.
LISTED FOR FIRE ALARM SYSTEM INSTALLATION.

THE PROJECT MANAGER OVERSEEING THE SYSTEM
INSTALLATION SHALL BE CERTIFIED AT A MINIMUM OF NICET
LEVEL IIl FOR FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS.

INSTRUCTIONS/SHOP DRAWING REQUIREMENTS

5.

THE FIRE ALARM DRAWINGS ARE SCHEMATIC IN NATURE
AND SHOW A MINIMAL QUANTITY OF DEVICES TO ESTABLISH
THE BASIS OF DESIGN FOR BIDDING. BASED ON THESE
DRAWINGS, THE CONTRACTOR SHALL BE KNOWLEDGEABLE
ABOUT THE APPLICABLE CODES AND STANDARDS TO
DETERMINE THE FINAL QUANTITY AND LOCATION OF ALL
REQUIRED DEVICES, INCLUDING NECESSARY MODULES, TO
PROVIDE A FULLY FUNCTIONING FIRE ALARM SYSTEM IN
COMPLIANCE WITH NFPA 72 SPECIFICATIONS. THIS MUST
ALSO ADHERE TO ALL RELEVANT CODES AND STANDARDS,
CONTRACT DRAWINGS, AND THE MANUFACTURER'S

6. THE CONTRACT DRAWINGS WERE CREATED BASED ON

AS-BUILT DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY THE STATE OF
MISSOURI. DUE TO THE AGE OF THE FACILITY, THE EXISTING
AS-BUILT DOCUMENTS ARE VERY LIMITED. THE ENGINEER
ASSESSED THE SITE CONDITIONS FROM THE FINISHED
FLOOR LEVEL WITHOUT USING DESTRUCTIVE METHODS.
THE CONTRACTOR SHALL ASSUME SOME DEVIATIONS AND
INCLUDE OFFSETS, ADDITIONAL WIRING, ETC, AT THE TIME
OF BID.

. MONITOR AND CONTROL MODULES SHALL BE PROVIDED BY

THE CONTRACTOR WHENEVER REQUIRED. MONITOR
MODULES ARE NOT SHOWN ON THESE PLANS BUT SHALL BE
SHOWN ON THE SHOP DRAWINGS. THE CONTRACTOR IS
EXPECTED TO PROVIDE ALL MODULES NECESSARY TO
SUPPORT ALL DEVICES AND OPERATIONS OUTLINED IN
THESE DOCUMENTS FOR A FULLY FUNCTIONING FIRE ALARM
SYSTEM.

. ITI1S THE CONTRACTOR'S RESPONSIBILITY TO PROVIDE

ACCURATE SHOP DRAWINGS THAT BUILD UPON THE
INFORMATION PRESENTED IN THESE DOCUMENTS.

a. TOENSURE A SMOOTH INSTALLATION PROCESS, THE
AWARDED CONTRACTOR SHALL VERIFY EXISTING
CONDITIONS SUCH AS LOCATIONS, DEPTHS, AND
ELEVATIONS, BY WALKING THE SITE PRIOR TO
SUBMITTING THE SHOP DRAWINGS.

b.  ANY MODIFICATION MADE TO THE DEVICE LAYOUT,
WIRING LAYOUT OR CONFIGURATION OF WIRING TO
NOTIFICATION OR INITIATING DEVICES SHALL BE
REVIEWED AND APPROVED BY AN FSC, INC.
REPRESENTATIVE.

c.  ANY NECESSARY REQUESTS FOR INFORMATION
(RFIS) RELATED TO CLARIFICATIONS OR SITE
CONDITIONS NOT DEPICTED IN THE DRAWINGS
SHOULD BE SUBMITTED PRIOR TO THE SHOP
DRAWINGS TO ENSURE THAT ACCURATE SHOP
DRAWINGS ARE PROVIDED FOR REVIEW AND
INSTALLATION.

d.  THE SHOP DRAWINGS MUST BE SUBMITTED AS A
COMPLETE PACKAGE INCLUDING ALL BUILDINGS FOR
REVIEW AND MUST COMPLY WITH NFPA 72
REQUIREMENTS. THIS INCLUDES FLOOR LAYOUT,
RISER DIAGRAMS WITH ADDRESSES FOR EACH
BUILDING, WIRE ROUTING, VOLTAGE DROP, AND
BATTERY CALCULATIONS. THE COMPLETE PACKAGE
OF SHOP DRAWINGS SHOULD BE PREPARED AND
STAMPED BY A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER
AND DEVELOPED UNDER THE SUPERVISION OF A
NICET LEVEL IV DESIGNER."

e. THE SEQUENCE OF OPERATIONS SHALL INCLUDE ALL
FUNCTIONS FOR THE ENTIRETY OF THE FACILITY AND
APPROVED BY THE STATE OF MISSOURI PRIOR TO
CONFIGURATION.

f.  FIBER CONNECTIVITY IS NOT INCLUDED IN FSC'S
SCOPE OF WORK. A CONTINUITY DIAGRAM OF THE
OM3 SITE FIBER NETWORK SHALL BE PROVIDED BY
THE CONTRACTOR FOLLOWING COORDINATION WITH
THE IT FACILITY AND MUST INCLUDE VERIFIED
CONNECTION LOCATIONS AT EACH BUILDING. FIBER

8.

10.

1.

12.

THE INSTALLATION OF THE FIRE ALARM SYSTEM SHALL NOT
BEGIN UNTIL THE DRAWINGS HAVE BEEN REVIEWED AND
APPROVED BY THE ENGINEER OF RECORD AND THE
AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION.

THE INSTALLATION CONTRACTOR MUST MAINTAIN A LEGIBLE
AND ACCURATE SET OF AS-BUILT (MARKED-UP) DRAWINGS
FOR RECORD-KEEPING PURPOSES. THE CONTRACTOR
SHALL PROVIDE THESE AS-BUILT PLANS TO FSC, INC. TO
FACILITATE PROPER RECORD-KEEPING BY THE
ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT AT FSC, INC.

THE STATE OF MO PROVIDED HVAC EQUIPMENT LAYOUTS
WHERE DOCUMENTS ARE AVAILABLE; FOR BIDDING
PURPOSES, WE ASSUME ONE HVAC UNIT CONTROL EXISTS
PER DUCT DETECTOR THAT WILL REQUIRE A CONTROL
MODULE FOR SHUTDOWN.

a.  ALL AIR HANDLER UNITS THAT ARE GREATER THAN
2,000 CFM SHALL BE EQUIPPED WITH A DUCT SMOKE
DETECTOR IN THE RETURN DUCT. VERIFY FINAL
LOCATION IN FIELD.

FSC, INC. SHALL BE NOTIFIED OF COMMISSIONING OF THE
SYSTEM AND SHALL BE PROVIDED ALL DOCUMENTATION
WITH RESPECT TO SYSTEM COMMISSIONING AND AHJ
ACCEPTANCE

THE EXISTING WIRING HAS BEEN OBSERVED TO BE IN POOR
CONDITION. BASED ON EXISTING CONDITIONS AND
REQUIRED SYSTEM MODIFICATIONS THE BIDDER SHOULD
ASSUME 10,000 FT OF THE EXISTING WIRING WILL NEED TO
BE REPLACED AND/OR RECONFIGURED AND A MINIMUM
5,000 FT OF NEW CONDUIT PATHWAYS WILL BE REQUIRED.
SEE UNIT PRICE SPECIFICATION 01 22 00.

SCOPE

13.

14.

15.

16.

THE FIRE ALARM PANELS SHALL BE NON-PROPRIETARY.

CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR PROVIDING ALL
CONDUITS, BOXES, ETC. AND FIBER FROM THE FACU TO
EACH BUILDING'S FIBER PATCH PANEL.

CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR ALL
TERMINATIONS AND PROGRAMMING, INCLUDING FIBER
MODULES (UTILIZING PROVIDED MULTIMODE OM3 FIBER (OR
SINGLE MODE) BACKBONE EXISTING ON SITE.

THE CONTRACTOR IS RESPONSIBLE FOR CONNECTING AND
INTEGRATING ALL FIRE ALARM UNITS INTO THE CAMPUS
NETWORK. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL:

a. COORDINATE WITH THE INTERNAL SITE IT
REPRESENTATIVES TO OBTAIN IP ADDRESSES AND
OTHER REQUIRED INFORMATION FOR NETWORK
PROGRAMMING.

b. PROGRAM OR ENGAGE A SUBCONTRACTOR TO
PROGRAM THE CAMPUS NETWORK SO ALL NEW
FACUS REPORT THE MAIN FACU THAT IS TO BE
LOCATED IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING'S MAIN

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

WHERE INDICATED ON THE DRAWINGS, THE FIRE SPRINKLER
FLOW SWITCH AND TAMPER SWITCH ARE TO BE REPLACED
ENTIRELY ALONG WITH THEIR ASSOCIATED MONITOR
MODULES. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL ENGAGE A SPRINKLER
CONTRACTOR TO REPLACE THE SPRINKLER SYSTEM
EQUIPMENT.

WHERE INDICATED ON THE DRAWINGS, PROVIDE A NEW
TAMPER SWITCH ON THE EXISTING FIRE SPRINKLER VALVE.
ENGAGE A SPRINKLER CONTRACTOR AS NECESSARY FOR
THIS WORK.

ALL SPRINKLER MONITORING DEVICES SHALL BE
MONITORED BY THE NEW FACUS.

SMOKE DETECTORS SHALL BE SPACED AS REQUIRED BY
NFPA 72 AND AS INDICATED ON THE DRAWINGS. A FSC, INC
REPRESENTATIVE SHALL REVIEW AND APPROVE ANY
CHANGES TO EXISTING CONDITIONS THAT MAY AFFECT THE
SMOKE DETECTOR LAYOUT DUE TO OBSTRUCTIONS.

FDC NOTIFICATION: PROVIDE NEW EXTERIOR
WEATHERPROOF HORN/STROBE FOR ALL BUILDINGS.

WHERE THE NOTIFICATION IS INTEGRATED AS PART OF THE
SPRINKLER SYSTEM BY WAY OF WATER ALARM MOTOR
GONGS, IT IS CONSIDERED PART OF THE SPRINKLER
SYSTEM AND IS NOT WITHIN THE FIRE ALARM SCOPE. THIS IS
THE SAME FOR PIVS WHERE PADLOCKS ARE PROVIDED.

EXISTING CIRCUITS SHALL BE TESTED FOR INTEGRITY TO
VERIFY THEY ARE FREE OF GROUNDS AND FAULTS PRIOR
TO INSTALLING NEW DEVICES AND ENERGIZING THE SYSTEM
TO ENSURE THE SYSTEM WILL FUNCTION PROPERLY.

ALL FINAL WIRING CIRCUITS TO BE CHECKED FOR PROPER
ELRD (END OF LINE RESISTOR DEVICE) READINGS TO
VERIFY CALCULATIONS, ROUTING ASSUMPTIONS, AND TO
ENSURE EACH LINE MAINTAINS THE VOLTAGE DROP
LIMITATIONS FOR A NEW SYSTEM (NO MORE THAN 80%
VOLTAGE DROP). ALL GROUND FAULTS AND SHORTS SHALL
BE ELIMINATED PRIOR TO FINAL ACCEPTANCE TESTING.

EXISTING DEVICES NOT REQUIRED BY THE APPLICABLE
CODE WILL BE REPLACED AT A ONE-TO-ONE RATIO IN THEIR
EXISTING LOCATIONS TO MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION THE SYSTEM WAS ORIGINALLY DESIGNED FOR.

WIRE GUARDS REQUIRED FOR SMOKE DETECTORS AND/OR
NOTIFICATION:

a.  WIRE GUARDS SHALL BE PROVIDED IN ALL
OFFENDER ACCESSIBLE LOCATIONS THAT ARE
MOUNTED AT 8 FT. AND LOWER. FOR BIDDING
PURPOSES, BIDDERS ARE TO ASSUME GENERAL
AREAS ACCESSIBLE TO OFFENDERS WILL BE
OUTFITTED WITH GUARDS.

b.  EXISTING WIRE GUARDS SHALL BE REPLACED AT A
ONE-TO-ONE RATIO IN NON-OFFENDER AREAS.

d.  WIRE GUARDS ARE NOT TO BE INSTALLED IN CEILING
TILES. PROVIDE TAMPER-PROOF DETECTORS IN LIEU
OF WIRE GUARDS.

e. ALL WIRE GUARDS SHALL BE UL LISTED AND ARE TO
BE METAL ONLY. PLASTIC IS NOT PERMITTED.

WIRING REQUIREMENTS:

26.

27.

28.

29.

30.

31.

32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

A BREAKER LOCK SHOULD BE INSTALLED AT THE
ELECTRICAL PANEL ON THE BRANCH CIRCUIT FEEDING ANY
FIRE ALARM PANEL. MUST BE IDENTIFIED BY RED AND
LABELED AS SERVING THE FIRE ALARM SYSTEM.

THE LOCATION OF THE DEDICATED BRANCH CIRCUIT
DISCONNECTING MEANS SHALL BE PERMANENTLY
IDENTIFIED AT THE CONTROL UNIT.

ALL FIRE ALARM CABLE SHALL BE INSTALLED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH ARTICLE 760 OF NFPA 70, NATIONAL
ELECTRICAL CODE.
a. PLENUM-RATED CABLE MUST BE INSTALLED IN ALL
PLENUM AREAS. RISERS NOT IN CONDUIT MUST USE
FPLP CABLE WHEN PENETRATING MORE THAN ONE
FLOOR.
b.  REFERTO SPECIFICATION 28 42 62 SECTION 2.17 A.2
FOR RACEWAY REQUIREMENTS IN OFFENDER AREAS.

NOTIFICATION APPLIANCE CIRCUITS ARE TO BE 16 AWG 2
CONDUCTOR SOLID FPLR, OR FPLP. THHN NOT PERMITTED.

SIGNALING LINE CIRCUITS ARE TO BE 18AWG 2 CONDUCTOR
SOLID FPLR, OR FPLP (PLENUM RATED) CABLE. THHN NOT
PERMITTED.

AC POWER FOR ALL FIRE ALARM CONTROL PANELS SHALL
BE 120VAC, 50/60 HZ, 20 AMPS. WIRE SHALL BE MINIMUM 12
AWG WITH 600V INSULATION.

ALL NON-POWERED LIMITED WIRING SHALL HAVE A MINIMUM
OF A 1/4" SEPARATION FROM POWERED LIMITED WIRING.

TEE-TAPPING IS ONLY PERMISSIBLE ON CLASS 'B' SLC
CIRCUITS WHEN NECESSARY TO ACCOMMODATE EXISTING
CONDITIONS.

ALL CIRCUITS SHALL BE IDENTIFIED AT TERMINAL AND
JUNCTION LOCATIONS WHICH WILL HELP PREVENT
UNINTENTIONAL SIGNALS TO OCCUR ON THE SYSTEM.

ALL FIRE ALARM DEVICES AND WIRING SHALL BE PROPERLY
LABELED WITH DEVICE AND WIRING IDENTIFICATION.
RECOMMEND LABELING ALL DEVICES WITH A GOOD LABEL
MAKER PRODUCT THAT DOES NOT FADE OVER TIME. SEE
SPECIFICATION 28 46 21 SECTION 2.17 FOR ACCEPTABLE
LABELING PRODUCTS.

INPUT MODULE AND NOTIFICATION APPLIANCE END OF LINE
RESISTORS ARE BY MANUFACTURER INSTRUCTIONS.

37.

38.

ALL NEW REQUIRED CABLING SHALL HAVE INDEPENDENT
SUPPORTS. UTILIZE TAMPER-PROOF SCREWS OR BRACKETS
ON ALL ACCESSIBLE SUPPORTS AND EQUIPMENT.

EMTs SHALL BE INSTALLED FOR ANY EXPOSED CABLES.

ADDITIONAL INSTRUCTIONS

39.

40.

41.

42.

43.

44,

45.

46.

ELEVATOR CONTROLS AND RECALL: SOME ELEVATORS ARE
CURRENTLY UNDERGOING MAINTENANCE OR WILL BE
REPLACED. FOR BIDDING PURPOSES, PROVIDE ALL
PASSENGER ELEVATORS WITH ELEVATOR RECALL TO
PRIMARY AND SECONDARY FLOOR, INCLUDING SHUNT TRIP
AND DETECTION IN THE ELEVATOR HOISTWAY AND HEAT
DETECTORS WITHIN 2FT OF ANY SPRINKLERS PROTECTING
ELEVATOR EQUIPMENT AS PRESCRIBED IN NFPA 72/13. THIS
DIRECTION WILL STAND UNTIL THE FINAL EVALUATION OF
EXISTING CONDITIONS CAN BE CONFIRMED POST-BID. THE
CONTRACTOR WILL COORDINATE ON-SITE WITH THE
ELEVATOR SUPPLIER AND FACILITIES FOR EXISTING
CONDITIONS.

A SMOKE DETECTOR SHALL BE PROVIDED ABOVE ALL FIRE
ALARM CONTROL UNITS AND NAC DEVICES.

REFER TO DETAIL 2 ON SHEET FA 004 FOR MOUNTING
REQUIREMENTS FOR FIRE ALARM EQUIPMENT.

WHERE (2) OR MORE STROBES AR VISIBLE THEY WILL BE
SYNCHRONIZED.

PROVIDE AUDIBILITY SOUND LEVEL OF 70 DBA
THROUGHOUT THE AREA OF WORK.

CONTRACTOR SHALL COORDINATE WITH ALL OTHER
EXITING EQUIPMENT AND SITE CONDITIONS
MECHANICAL/ELECTRICAL/PLUMBING) FOR EXACT LOCATION
OF CEILING / WALL MOUNTING OF FIRE ALARM DEVICES.

DOOR HOLDS SHALL BE POWERED BY THE FIRE ALARM
SYSTEM.

PROVIDE ISOLATION MODULES TO ISOLATE CIRCUITS PER
ZONE. AT A MINIMUM, PROVIDE ONE ISOLATION MODULE
PER ADDITIONAL FLOOR. PER NFPA 72, EACH FLOOR IS
CONSIDERED A ZONE. WHERE RE-WIRING IS REQUIRED DUE
TO THE AGE AND CONDITION OF THE WIRE, PROVIDE
ISOLATION MODULES BETWEEN SECURE AND NON-SECURE
AREAS WHERE APPLICABLE.

FIRE ALARM SYMBOL LEGEND

SYMBOL DESCRIPTION

ADDRESSABLE FIRE ALARM CONTROL UNIT

INTELLIGENT NOTIFICATION APPLIANCE
CIRCUITS

(@)

N FIRE ALARM ANNUNCIATOR PANEL (FAAP)

VIDEO DISPLAY UNIT WITH LCD MONITOR,
D AND KEYBOARD

S R < I 2 M < A
o = )
sl € = c

FIRE ALARM DOCUMENT BOX

[FIX | MANUAL PULL STATION, K: KEY OPERATED
® ADDRESSABLE SMOKE DETECTOR
@, |DUCTMOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR (FOR
HOUSING UNITS)
(E’) DUCT SMOKE DETECTOR
ADDRESSABLE CARBON MONOXIDE DETECTOR
ADDRESSABLE HEAT DETECTOR
DOOR HOLDER
I REMOTE TEST STATION (RTS)
DUAL OR SINGLE INPUT MODULE(S)
CONTROL MODULE
o FIRE ALARM STROBE (CEILING MOUNT)
R FIRE ALARM STROBE (WALL MOUNT)
[0k] |FIREALARM HORN STROBE (WALL MOUNT)
c[eX] |FIRE ALARM HORN STROBE (CEILING MOUNT)
@ WATER FLOW SWITCH
'®. | VESDA MONITORING DEVICE
@ TAMPER SWITCH
HIGH PRESSURE SWITCH
LOW PRESSURE SWITCH

s | \/VESDA PIPING

FIRE ALARM ABBREVIATIONS

LEGEND
ABBREVIATION DESCRIPTION
DM DEMOLISH EXISTING DEVICE TO RELOCATE
E EXISTING DEVICE
N NEW DEVICE

RELOCATION OF NEAREST EXISTING DEVICE TO

R LOCATION INDICATED.

AFF ABOVE FINISHED FLOOR
AHJ AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION
AHU AIR HANDLING UNIT
BAS BUILDING AUTOMATION SYSTEM
CD CANDELA
DOC DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
EOL END OF LINE
EMT ELECTRICAL METALLIC TUBING
FDC FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTION
P IP ADDRESS
NAC NOTIFICATION APPLIANCE CIRCUIT
NFPA NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION ASSOCIATION
NTS NOT TO SCALE
OA OFFICES OF ADMINISTRATION FOR THE STATE OF
MISSOURI
oM OPTICAL MULTIMODE FIBER
PWR AUXILIARY POWER
RDP REMOTE DISPLAY
SLC SIGNALING LINE CIRCUIT
UL UNDERWRITERS LABORATORIES
WG WIRE GUARD
WP WEATHERPROOF DEVICE

WRITTEN RECOMMENDATIONS. PATCH PANEL'S LOCATIONS AND CONNECTIVITY SECURITY OFFICE WHERE INDICATED ON THE el it aidvianiivell WHERE POSSIBLE, ALWAYS USE OEM SUPPLIED
DETAILS TO FIRE ALARM CONTROL UNITS SHALL DRAWINGS. SHALL BE REMOVED AND REPLACED RESISTORS. WHERE OEM SUPPLIED RESISTORS ARE NOT
PROVIDED AND TO BE INDICATED ON LAYOUTS. : AVAILABLE, USE RESISTOR COLOR CODE TO SELECT THE
PROPER RESISTOR, MATCHING VALUES TO OEM SUPPLIED
RESISTOR.
AUTOMATIC
FIRE ALARM REMOTE NOTIFY MONITORING | PUBLIC PUBLIC HVAC ELEVATOR CONTROL AND DOOR
CONTROL PANEL ANNUNCIATOR STATION VISUALS | AUDIBLES EMERGENCY OPERATION RELEASE
Zs > | « I~ 2 ¥% |xU
s 2258 £8 £8 § .32 83y
S5 E3 ADMIN. BUILDING =285 29 | 2 3 S8ES0zz 588
oz|o% £S5 @ | dg  wE SEESEEDE
o= <E=1Z240 .0 o= = = <OY | <w
8b Sb & 82 o o 2 & RZ2 |RER
22 9y <78% oS- | mF |G 24 23 NOTES:
ALM | TRB | SUP | ® 7| & ALM | TRB | SUP | ALM TRB SuP ON | OFF | ON | OFF O &« &« < <m (<= -
AREA SMOKE DETECTOR o ® & O o ® o o AS INDICATED ON PLANS
0
pa
8 AREA HEAT DETECTOR DETECTOR ® ® & © ® ® ® @ AS INDICATED ON PLANS
a MANUAL PULL STATION o ® & O o ® o o DUAL ACTION TYPE WITH STOPPER II
=
S DUCT SMOKE DETECTOR (HVAC) ® O & O ® ® O 0 O GLOBAL HVAC SHUTDOWN
=
% DUCT SMOKE DETECTOR (CELL) o ® & O o o o ® O o
< 1ST FLOOR ELEVATOR LOBBY SMOKE o ® & O o ® o o o PRIMARY RECALL
—
= 2ND FLOOR ELEVATOR LOBBY SMOKE o ® & O o @ o o o ALTERNATE RECALL
L
& ELEVATOR SHAFT/EQUIP ROOM SMOKE ® O & © ® @ ® @ ®
U
ELEVATOR SHAFT/EQUIP ROOM HEAT ® O & o ® @ ® ® O ELEVATOR SHUNT TRIP - SUPERVISED
LLI
% VESDA SMOKE DETECTION ® ® & O ® ® ®
S SPRINKLER WATERFLOW o ® & O o ® o o SPRINKLER WATERFLOW
§ SPRINKLER TAMPER SWITCH ® O O o ® o o SPRINKLER TAMPER SWITCH
< KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION SYSTEM ® O & © ® ® O @ KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION SYSTEM
<<
AC POWER FAILURE o ® O o o o AUTOMATIC DOOR RELEASE
w o SINGLE LINE CIRCUIT (SLC) SINGLE OPEN, GROUND, OR SHORT o ® O o o (SLC) - CLASS B
pa
[—
i 8 INITIATING DEVICE CIRCUIT (HTRI) SINGLE OPEN, GROUND, OR SHORT o ® O o o (IDC) - CLASS B
a
X Z NOTIFICATION APPLIANCE CIRCUIT (NAC) SINGLE OPEN, GROUND, OR SHORT NAC) - CLASS B
=5 (NAC) ® ® O ® ® (NAC)
(a
comm. FAULT ® oo ° °
LOW BATTERY ® ® o ® o
o W
o % SIGNAL SILENCE (AUDIBLES OFF) o o ()
i
n 3
= SYSTEM RESET o o o

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

AR
NUMBER
PE-2020010419

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

\ _J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
e —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

100% BID SET
05/14/2025

REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

FIRE ALARM
GENERAL NOTES

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-002

3 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



CANTEEN
OFFICE
FACU

PROPERTY
BUILDING
FACU

EDUCATION
BUILDING
FACU

LAUNDRY
FACU

CENTER
BUILDING
FACU

FIBER OPTIC CABLE (BY OTHER)

BUCHANAN
BUILDING
FACU

ADMINISTRATION
BUILDING
FACU

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
OFFICE
FACU

VESDA

DH

@

MM CM@CMF

MM

O @@

7
“wv— MM H MM

CONTRACTOR TO COORDINATE WITH HEAD OF

MAINTENANCE FOR FIBER TYPE / SPEED,

SWITCHES AND REQUIRED CONNECTIVITY TO

FACUs

PARK BUILDING
FACU

POWER HOUSE

FACU

NOTE: FIBER PROJECT IS NOT UNDER FSC SCOPE OF WORK. NEW
FACILITY FIBER LOOP IS A SEPARATE ON-GOING PROJECT. COORDINATE

WITH FACILITY STAFF TO VERIFY TIE-IN POINT AT THE TIME OF FIRE ALARM
INSTALLATION.

1 CAMPUS FIBER RISER DIAGRAM

SCALE: NTS

ILS (REGIONAL)

BUILDING
BASEMENT
FACU

NAC
0 (IF REQUIRED) o ® ®
[ ] [ ) [ )
> ) 0 |
ANNUNCIATOR
FIRE ALARM
CONTROL UNIT
(FACU)

o\

2 SCHEMATIC RISER DIAGRAM

SCALE: NTS

CANTEEN
OFFICE

12

EDUCATION
BUILDING 9
E116

24

CENTER
BUILDING 6
B213

PROPERTY
BUILDING 8

12

BUCHANAN
BUILDING 11
115E

LAUNDRY
BUILDING 7

24

36

36

12

R&D
BUILDING 10
A107
(ADMIN)

12

PARK
BUILDING 1
220E

12

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING1 00
OFFICE

12

24

FIRE ALARM RISER KEYED NOTES:

@ TYPICAL NAC CIRCUITS.

@ TYPICAL INITIATION DEVICE CIRCUITS.

@ TYPICAL END OF LINE RESISTOR.

NOTIFICATION APPLIANCE CIRCUIT EXPANDER
PANEL. PROVIDE QUANTITY AS NECESSARY.
VERIFY LOCATION WITH OWNER PRIOR TO
INSTALLATION.

@ WIRING TO ELEVATOR CONTROL.

@ PROVIDE A REMOTE TEST STATION FOR DUCT

MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTORS NOT
ACCESSIBLE FROM THE FINISHED FLOOR IN A
SECURE LOCATION. VERIFY FINAL LOCATION
WITH OWNER.

MONITOR MODULES FOR SPRINKLER SYSTEM
SUPERVISION.

e WIRING TO DOOR HOLD.

CONNECT FACU TO FIBER BACKBONE OF
CAMPUS NETWORK AT LOCATION PROVIDED
WITHIN BUILDING.

WIRING TO ELEVATOR SHUNT TRIP.

GATE HOUSE
BUILDING 14

POWER
HOUSE

3 FIBER NETWORK (BY OTHERS)

SCALE: NTS

ILS
(REGIONAL)

BUILDING 101
BASEMENT

12

GARAGE
BUILDING 102
OFFICE

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

PROFESSIONAL SEAL

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

FIRE ALARM
SCHEMATIC
RISER DIAGRAM

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-003

4 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



SYNCHRONIZE MORE THAN TWO APPLIANCES IN
ANY FIELD OF VIEW

CEILING MOUNTED/

NOTIFICATION DEVICE (TYP.)

CEILING MOUNTED
DETECTOR (TYP.)

—f f f

SMOKE DETECTOR MOUNTED
ABOVE FACP ON SUSPENDED CEILING

HORN STROBE LOCATED

s Pl

OUTSIDE ABOVE
F 9

DC.\\ . %

/

1. FIRE ALARM CONTROL PANEL
2. J-BOX
3. WATER FLOW SWITCH
4. SPRINKLER ALARM VALVE
5. SUPERVISORY TAMPER SWITCH
MANUAL PULL STATION
ALARM VALVE OS&Y
SMOKE DETECTOR
HORN STROBE (WEATHERPROOF)
LIQUID TIGHT FLEX CONDUIT SLC.

SECERNES)

TO CENTER OF LENS OR
WITHIN 6" BELOW THE CEILING
WHICHEVER IS LOWER

1 GENERIC FIRE SPRINKLER RISER

SCALE: NTS

1
REMOTE ANNUNCIATOR
PANEL
L= n t
NAC
EXTENDER
PANEL I FACU
FAAP
NO MORE THAN 200' TO
EXIT DOOR ANOTHER PULL STATION
5'
MAXIMUM
WALL-MOUNTED APPLIANCES SHALL
BE MOUNTED SUCH THAT THE
Q F ENTIRE LENS 80" TO 96" A.F.F.
4 6 AF.F. 6 AFF.
MAX. 5 AFF. MAX.
MAX.
MOUNTING HEIGHT
TO CENTER OF MECHANISM
PER NFPA 72: 42'< X< 48"
PERIBC: | 42'<X<48"
PERADA: | 44'<X<48"
'
2 FIRE ALARM STANDARD MOUNTING HEIGHTS
SCALE: NTS
DO NOT MOUNT DETECTOR IN THIS AREA
MOUNT FIRST
DETECTOR ANYWHERE 4"
IN HATCHED AREA N}
SLOPE CEILING
-~ 36" 36" =]
MAXIMUM MAXIMUM
UNACCEPTABLE HERE UNACCEPTABLE HERE UNACCEPTABLE HERE @ @

36" 36" 36’ ACCEPTABLE HERE .
MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM ( A W%MAIfNJ

@ wﬁ % @ 1S s s s — ‘@
/\/\/\
M % S = LISTED SPACING OF DETECTOR 0P OF HEAT DETECTOR
/\/\/\ ACCEPTABLE HERE

/\/\/\ HVAC CEILING DIFFUSER
HVAC CEILING DIFFUSER

HVAC WALL DIFFUSER

3 DETECTOR MOUNTING DETAIL

SCALE: NTS

!

4" MIN.

1

12" MAX

NOTES:
1.

DO NOT INSTALL ANY EQUIPMENT
OUTSIDE UNLESS IT IS LISTED FOR
OUTDOOR USE.

FOR LOW CEILINGS WHERE THE
MOUNTING HEIGHTS CAN NOT BE MET
MOUNT THE INDICATED APPLIANCE (EX.
HORN STROBES) 6" FROM THE CEILING.

ALL DEVICES AND APPLIANCE HEIGHTS
SHOULD BE CONSISTENT FOR THE ENTIRE
PROJECT.

THE FIRE PANEL SHALL HAVE A MINIMUM
OF 3 FT CLEARANCE FROM THE FRONT OF
THE CONTROL EQUIPMENT AND BE
LOCATED IN A CLIMATE CONTROLLED
AREA.

VERIFY ALL DIMENSIONS PROVIDED PER
THE APPLICABLE STANDARDS AND
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE PROJECT.
INSTALLATION MUST COMPLY WITH LOCAL
REQUIREMENTS GOVERNING MINIMUM
STANDARDS FOR THIS SYSTEM.

NOTES:
1.

MEASUREMENTS SHOWN ARE TO THE
CLOSEST EDGE OF THE DETECTOR.

DETECTORS SHALL NOT BE LOCATED IN
DIRECT AIR FLOW OR CLOSER THAT 36"
FROM AN AIR SUPPLY DIFFUSER.

AVOID LOCATING SMOKE DETECTORS IN
CLOSE PROXIMITY TO DOMESTIC HEAT.

AVOID LOCATING SMOKE DETECTORS IN
CLOSE PROXIMITY TO DOMESTIC SMOKE
SOURCES SUCH AS KITCHENS AND AREAS
OF RELATIVELY HIGH HUMIDITY WHERE
CONDENSATION MAY OCCUR.

DO NOT INSTALL SMOKE DETECTORS
UNTIL ALL CONSTRUCTION IS FINAL AND
COMPLETE. DETECTORS INSTALLED
PRIOR TO FINAL CLEANUP BY ALL TRADES
SHALL BE CLEANED OR REPLACED.

INSTALL ALL SMOKE DETECTORS ON THE
CEILING, UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE.

DO NOT MOUNT DETECTORS DIRECTLY
ADJACENT TO FLUORESCENT LIGHTS, IT IS
RECOMMENDED A MINIMUM DISTANCE OF
1 FOOT IS MAINTAINED.

MOUNT SMOKE DETECTORS A MINIMUM
OF 3 FEET OUTSIDE BATHROOMS WHICH
HAVE SHOWERS.

FOR BEAMS WITH DEPTHS EXCEEDING 1'
OR CEILINGS OVER 12" IN HEIGHT,
DETECTORS SHALL BE MOUNTED IN
EVERY BEAM POCKET.

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

PROFESSIONAL SEAL

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT #
SITE #

ASSET #

C232501
7012

9327012063

100% BID SET
05/14/2025

REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE:
DRAWN BY:
CHECKED BY:
DESIGNED BY:

FSC
DD/SS
JIMA
FSC

SHEET TITLE:

TYPICAL
EQUIPMENT
MOUNTING
GUIDELINES

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-004

5 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



KEY NOTES FOR

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

gl
=| = (1) LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
| CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
| NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.
1? @ h | @ OPEN OFFICE CLASSROOM CLASSROOM % @ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
- | Py MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
. WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
® ° | i OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
| &K BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
® B En
| % & CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
(5125 ]
comenen | B . CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
AFTER THIS POINT @i 5% OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.
X" : | ® .
VISITING VISITING ST | @R GUARD el T)@ @ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
75 S STATION 75
== i = KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION FSC INC
ome | el oo %q d SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE NeERS LLC.
= é ALARM SYSTEM. N ’ y
’ &, | © ¥ % BICd 8675 W 96TH STREET
& | 5D{E]) 0 i ® (4] PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
ofh S E . CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO PHONE: 816.33.4373
| o MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND FAX. 913.722.3484
oA s | Chizs SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
® l Z WoRK NEW_OFFICE NEW_OFFICE
® =lE=
Sl (5] MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
w2 e A2 OCCUPIABLE
o % | A0~ o) FA100-3
5 (6] EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
o RS | ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
® REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
@, MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.
TRANSFER OPEN 5:._15
wp w:rg;c ST. co:gaore |
GENERAL NOTES:
é%g TRANSFER CLOTHNG EXCH 7s{®] [Klrs SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
CELLS A140 g——
0 5 10’ 20’
N 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
N & oy o o ga DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
® S o mo ow s ms s ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
® o cA Em e | m m DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS. OFFICE OF
0.0, 0.0, 0.0, ®.0, ® ®.0, 2.0, 0.0, .0, ADMINISTRATION
¢ : MANAGEMENT.
VEHICLE HOLDING ®,
s, @, @ 4" SQUARE JUNCTION BOX ’
3/4" CONDUIT DOWN DESIGN AND
TO LOWER CELL CONSTRUCTION
@ R
' e ) i @,
% 3 ] & 5 3/4" ELEX WITH (L’ OWER DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
& ® INTERFACE LOOP TO SD CELL AREA
ON EACH SIDE OF CHASE )
e . 8 4"x1-1/2" DEEP BOX MOUNT TO —/— EXHAUST Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
: R = 7 BACK OF ACCESS DOOR AIR Multiple Assets
C168
ACCESS DOOR
e & EXHAUST AIR BOOT WESTERN RECEPTION AND
2 8. (BY DIVISION 15) DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
NOTE: CENTER
00, o0, 00, o0, [ 00, 00, o0, o, FOR INFORMATION ONLY. DETAIL PROVIDED BY DOC FROM EXISTING FIRE
CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL gEEL gEEL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL ALARM DOCUMENTATION TYPICAL FOR EACH CELL 3401 FARAON ST'
[c165 ] [cres ] [ci163 ] [ c162 ] [ciet ] [cieo | [ c159 ] [ci58 ] [c129] [cres | [ c127 | [ci26 ] [c125 ] [c124 ] [c123 ] [ c122 | ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
2 CELL SMOKE DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAIL
& SCALE: NTS
2 o] o] = PROJECT # (C232501
& SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
MAINTENANCE
%2 %: BUILDING
SUILDIGG | REVISION: 100% BID SET
REV]IDS%I]\EI: 05/14/2025
S DATE:
3 s \TER REVISION:
CELL CELL CE NG DATE:
guno PARK '
BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
®,
© CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: JMA
gE‘CI')E/ICE‘I)'EO;g%ﬁ:CVCSA?ﬂELESRSOBAO?:ﬁEOUSING, ®0, ®0, ®0, ®0, BUCHANA Ej/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
ONE PER CELL (TYPICAL FOR ALL HOUSING UNITS) BUILDING D\
ON ALL FLOORS WITH THIS CONFIGURATION. SEE CELL el CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL PROPERTY
DETAIL 2 ON FA-200 FOR ADDITIONAL [cres ] [cia7]  [ctae ] [c1e5 ]  [cr2] [c141]  [Ccia0 ] [cis9 ] ' STORAGE SHEET TITLE:

INFORMATION.

ADMIN BUILDING -

ﬁ\ BUILDING

T EDUGATION FIRST FLOOR
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN Aa B FIRE ALARM PLAN
1 SCALE: 1/16" =1'-0" : \
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:

FA-100

6 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

KEY NOTES FOR
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

N N (1] LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
S S CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
= | = NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.
[2)IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
_ & MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
W, ML o SEARCH WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
7oN
MO OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
© ® BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
5, 3, CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
2 e T CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
30N RECEPTION e CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
ENTRANCE LogBY OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.
VESTIBULE ® © (3) PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
(i KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION FSC INC
SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE ENGINEERS LLC'
ALARM SYSTEM. \ : Y,
8675 W 96TH STREET
_— CONEERENCE SECURE AREA @ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
A120 AFTER THIS POINT @y CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO PHONE: 816.33.4373
5 ﬁ MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND FAX:913.722.3484
2 SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
= ‘ V‘ASE‘EG ‘ ‘ V‘ASEH;C l SALLYPORT — S.T.
CONTROL INEE Res [ AL @ MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
o @ OCCUPIABLE
I—:.j5 I.T.
Caie] an] @ e 8] EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
(Eacy) [, ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
® REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
O CORRIDOR MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.
A125
RECORDS
OPEN DFFICE CORRIDOR GENERAL NOTES:
SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
. e T —
OX “SSuE . i 0 PR 20
s SUPT. |4 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
® A129 L DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
® SHi= ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
L DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS. OFFICE OF
e FA100-2 ADMINISTRATION
" o Oﬁ DIVISION OF FACILITIES
o ® MANAGEMENT,
HOLDING Ny ATST DESIGN AND
INTAKE %5
fiit SENNETC CONSTRUCTION
A148 A150 A151 ®@
ASSIGN.
é% PROPERTY OFFICE
0 STORAGE DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
A124
TRANSFER o
. cAEtbs WEEEN:G ”; CORRIDOR
o Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
N Multiple Assets
75 TR&N&FSER CLOTSHH\%%EEXCH. p
A46 A140
WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
SALLYPORT
" ai] & N | CENTER
® N 3401 FARAON ST.
\EASEE ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
O !
[ A143 ] TRANSFER
. o fiies PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012
HOLDING
Sl I o ASSET# 9327012063
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS 0
Y / REVISION: 100% BID SET
BUILDING DATE: _ 05/14/2025
REVISION:
7% DATE:
R REVISION:
CENTE :
< Bu\\—D‘NG PARK DATE:
" BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: IMA
BUCHANA Ej/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUILDING L PROPERTY
STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING
ADMIN BUILDING
EDUCATION
PUEOE IE:EETA\EI;\%S/IRPLAN
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
SCALE: 3/32" = 10" PART-1
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-100-1

7 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



L~

FA100-1

FA100-2

KEY NOTES FOR

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.

@ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION
SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE
ALARM SYSTEM.

@ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

@ MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
OCCUPIABLE

ces 8] EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
STORAGE ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
@ OPEN OFFICE CLASSROQOM CLASSROOM REQU'RE A SEPARATE CONTROL
e = e w1 X MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.
ﬂ ELECTRICAL 5
GENERAL NOTES:
ELECTRICAL N
AT09 [eK]7s
A110B ® N N 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
ARCHIVES DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
STAR ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
s 5o DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS.
S POINT ©752E 1 O
B102
@
(5 GUARD 75 N
S.T. 75
Hels OFFICE S;/?EEN % el
B103 DIGS ELEC. 75N
Beis LT EQUIPMENT o [B100 ]
N B108A
R 75, v JAN.
(El, © WORK STAT\/(:& B -Bi;é -Bsw;s
@ COPY NEZRENA 5
COARE‘DSOR 75DE @ B149 é\ @(h @
SEC. LTS. SHIFT CORRIDOR
ASSOC, QIR T [ Broe ]
SAgZ; f (‘\‘ évggg WAITING NEW OFFICE NEW OFFICE
(- [a>) -8105
E E A127
FA100-2 ST FA100-2
FA100-3 -COCRS(‘)%OR FA100-3
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 BUILDING
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"
R
CENTE
guILDN® PARK
BUILDING
LAUNDRY
BUCHANA [:}/ BUILDING
BUILDING L PROPERTY
STORAGE
BUILDING
EDUCATION
BUILDING
ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

& v

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501

SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE:
REVISION:

DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: TMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
SHEET TITLE:
ADMIN BUILDING
FIRST FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
SHEET NUMBER:
FA-100-2

8 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



AlSS

RRIDOR
\134

CELL
C175

CELL
C174

CELL
C173

CELL
C172

CELL
C169

CELL
C168

CELL
C167

CELL
C166

KEY NOTES FOR

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.

@ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION
SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE
ALARM SYSTEM.

@ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

@ MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
OCCUPIABLE

@ EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS.

PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

E:}/ BUILDING
I ——  PROPERTY

SUPT. — | ~ =
A129 | | ggg& WAITING NEW OFFICE NEW OFFICE
=l= 127 ] -
< =
Ly L
CAPT.
_ STORAGE FA100-2
PiES FA100-2 S
- _ CORRIDOR _
@ MOEFDF“CCAEL FAWOO 3 FAWOO 3)
A131
ASSIGN.
OFFICE
A132
rop{e] (eKs
N
5 e CORRIDOR
~
PUMRUP%‘SE .
SALLYPORT CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL
- - - L - - L CHEEL [ clo5 | [ ci06 ] [cto7 ] [cio8 | [ci09 ] [crio ] [ citd
CORRIDOR ST
c176 c177 c178 C179 180 c181 c182 183
| | | | | | | | \ Cigd
©D ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D 1’ ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D
CELL
c112
©D ©D
@, ®,
CELL
C113
SECURE | CELL
CORRIDOR v C114
® DAYROOM c187 N DAYROOM ®,
D 171A 116A
@, WING 1 ](2) WING D | (2) ®,
CELL
c115
®
CONTROL
c185 CELL
- c118
z DAYROOM
DAYROOM
®, 170A T17A ®,
®, WING H | (2) WING E | (2) ®,
CELL
N CELL
151 @N C120
® OFFICE s ®,
D
@ cl186 @,
CELL
OPEN
OFFICE
®Q, ®0, ®®, 10} [ -] 10} ®®, ®Q, @0,
H.C. H.C.
CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL
c165 | [ c164 | [ c1e3 ] [ cie2 ] [ cie1 ] [c160 ] [ C159 ] [ cis8 [ c129 ] [ c128 | [ c127 ] [ci26 | [c125 ] [c124 ] [ci23] [c122
N
DAYROOM DAYROOM
& Cl44 C143 e
® WING G (2) WING F | (2) ®
D D
©D ©D
CELL CELL
Ciss
CELL CELL
C133
@, ®,
®, ®,
CELL CELL
€153 C134
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
CELL CELL ILS
152 C135 BUILDING °
©D ©D
©D ©D
CELL CELL
Csg CENTER
DG
sy
CELL CELL
€150 c137
®,
@,
CELL
C138
BUCHANA
BUILDING
PROVIDE TWO DUCT MOUNTED SMOKE @0, ®®, ®Q, @0,

DETECTORS WITH WEATHER PROOF HOUSING,
ONE PER CELL (TYPICAL FOR ALL HOUSING UNITS)

ON ALL FLOORS WITH THIS CONFIGURATION. SEE CELL CELL

CELL CELL CELL CELL

CELL

CELL

DETAIL 2 ON FA-200 FOR ADDITIONAL ci48 | [ c147 ]

[ci46 | [ cia5 | [ c142 ]

[ c141 ]

[ c140 |

[ c139

INFORMATION.

1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-3

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

‘e _‘g‘x:\j\\>\\;fi;\\\\¥
ADMIN

; STORAGE
\\ BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

\_

_/

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501

SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE:
REVISION:

DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: TMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
SHEET TITLE:
ADMIN BUILDING
FIRST FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-3
SHEET NUMBER:
FA-100-3

9 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

KEY NOTES FOR
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:
1JLOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE

CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

T
¢
30" ARMOR
0

&
o

e

G
SO

0SA o)

&

OPEN TO BELOW

oS

=

THE CARPET

o e
IR w
,0He8

CONFERENCE

CORRIDOR

0SA
-] Z CONFERENCE
G

o . T BREAKROOM A2 7 RADIOLOGY RADIOLOGY ggpggﬁgLoF%LOTEFéqr\Sﬁﬁg\’ﬂOKE
re’ TREATMENT TRIAGE DENTAL LAB 8225
1 © © | o ® o © e EOToRS N TOANEL S o MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
d ©)] WORK @ CONNECTED TO ADMIN FACU.
| e ) " = WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
l:l . B221 %N B226
® 7, . v o 0 . (o BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET PROFESSIONAL SEAL
’ CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN .
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX =
STORAGE 8209 WAITING AREA < 8255
¥ o g OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.
® VY 5 resry 2 KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION FSC INC
i3 % SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE ]

o0 o ® © ® MECHANICAL PROVIDE (6) SMOKE DETECTORS AS @ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
3 ® ® vien % N OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
® Do g @K
SOILED ¥
el ® 5 wes sion (g0 Bt CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
N EXAM @ @ E;gm OFFICE @
D finf ® 3] PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
CART_STORAGE s EREN G} ENGINEERS, LLC

J

|
i NURSING BLOOD DRAW fi (827 ] ALARM SYSTEM. \_
ROOM -BZOG =i
| E o 8675 W 96TH STREET
|

N STORAGE @N
® ®

X e o) o ® . ® Cos] © ® ® (4] PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
” i # CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO PHONE: 816.33.4373

mow = MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND FAX: 913.722.3484

o ) G| O o SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

\LPERSONNEL OFFICER

S s |

0sA CORRIDOR

DEPUTY %
WARDEN ® -] RECORDS ©|L£| 219 %R

-] ) -]
rel7s
BUSINESS
RECORD
OFFICE OFFICE

MAJOR'S -m

OFFICE

BUSINESS CHIEF OF TRAINING
MGR. CUSTODY OFFICE

: T
S

[ B259 B260 B261 B262 | [ B263 B264 @ MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE _ NOT

FAIO1-1 ! FAT01- N i  mo OCCUPIABLE

FAI01-3 FAI01-3 I | FATO1-
| (6) EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS

® o ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
| REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
® MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.

N b

(T
O

AHU-8

- GENERAL NOTES:

& &Kz SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
AHU-10 ey —

& ] 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE ° 20

R

] ® DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
Gos]  [ooio ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE

cEL
€201 MULTI-PURPOSE €203 c204 C205 C206 c207 208 209 210
CELL CELL ¢ \ | \ | | | | | | |

Con [ O] Cob o Con Co | o DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS. OFFICE OF
®.0, ®.0, .0, ®.0, AL - ®.0, ©,9, 0,0, ®.0, ADMINISTRATION
sEcurny DIVISION OF FACILITIES

275 EQUIPMENT [cari ]

2 = D MANAGEMENT,
CELL ’ AHU-6 DE SIGN AND

] @ CORRIDOR CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL

©

o)

CELL ® C UPPER Ao o <<> ® ® CONSTRUCTION
(o ® 00 KO DRTROOM e
@ ® * ® C-_WQNEEEO ®
%j 6 %% ® @ ®, " DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
110 1
5 ® *
CELL @ 6’0 ® (6 MECHANICAL g CELL
> 0 % _
9 & & . Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
A UPPER ®, :
T ® ® AR ggg; Multiple Assets
® “, ° ¢ s
® ® ® & ® ®
wos a4 WESTERN RECEPTION AND
9 i ¢ s g DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER
@, @0®, GION ®p, yest ®r, BIO) 90, GION
CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL ® ® = CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL 3401 FARAON ST.
[c26e5 ] [co64 ] [ c263 | [ c262 | [ce61 ] [ cze0 | [ c259 ] [[c258 ] [ce27 ] [c226 ] [[c225 | [ c224 | [[c223 ] [ c222 | [ ca21 ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
STORAGE
DAYRGOM DAYROOM
L cfi71_BeLq) of71 BeLg] -
] e . ) PROJECT # (232501
8 8 SITE # 7012

€255

ASSET # 9327012063

o oD (e L MAINTENANCE
g ; BUILDING

RS Cose ILS REVISION: 100% BID SET

®
@

®
(SIS

BUILDING DATE:  05/14/2025
CELL CELL REVISION
~ DATE:
CELL %Z ©Z CELL CENTER REVI SION :
® ® BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
®, O]
CELL D CELL CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
Clo °® ®® o® BUCHANAN g/ o e CHECKED BY: IMA
PROVIDE TWO DUCT MOUNTED SMOKE Vi ’ 7 J BUILDING DESIGNED BY FSC
DETECTORS WITH WEATHER PROOF HOUSING, CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL PROPERTY
ON ALL FLOORS WITH THIS GONFIGURATION. SEE. we] [ov) [ee] [as] [ee] [oa] [eo] (o ! STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
ST oA rom AT 7 BUILDING ADMIN BUILDING
00 EDUCATION E ND FL R
A\ P I BUILDING SECO 00

AL - FIRE ALARM PLAN

ADMIN

BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:

FA-101

1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN

SCALE: 1/16" = 1'-0"

10 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

KEY NOTES FOR
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:
1JLOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE

CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.

@ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR

KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION FSC I N C .

SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE ENGINEERS, LLC

ALARM SYSTEM. \_ J
8675 W 96TH STREET
@ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO PHONE: 816.33.4373
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND FAX: 913.722.3484
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
. (5] MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
=< OCCUPIABLE
==
- @ EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
| F 3;01 . MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.
WARDEN'S CONFERENCE
OFFICE ROOM BREAKROOM @j @ GENERAL NOTES
- T FT [ A204 ] [ A205 ] .
A203 ® ® © v : SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
15, NI 75 S ——
A I A WOMEN'S 0 5 10 20
@ 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
& RESOURCES @ DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
- ® & ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
-] o o ® DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS. OFFICE OF
2 ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
DEPUTY CORRIDOR |§| MANAGEMENT,
® "
WARDEN 30 DESIGN AND
* ® CONSTRUCTION
© T CARRET © iO(N DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
|:| :125; CONFERENCE
A211
0SA CORRIDOR
-] % CONEREICE e Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
- ] Multiple Assets
Eoi roou” (5]
S@f Kb WESTERN RECEPTION AND
0SA CORRIDOR " B DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
WARDEN © [ - ] RECORDS @storace A219 R
RECORD SOPRGE 3401 FARAON ST
) OFFICE BUSINESS CHIEF OF TRAINING ~ (@ .
MAIOR'S LA;RE.; CUASZT%DY OAF;%E é éPERAS;!éNEL ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
T T
PROJECT # (C232501
FAIDT-T FAT01-2 SITE # 7012
FA101=3 TUEN ASSET # 0327012063
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS 0
/ REVISION: 100% BID SET
BUILDING DATE: _ 05/14/2025
% REVISION:
1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 /% = REVISTOL.
SCALE: 3/32" = 1-0" % cEV e DATE:
] gunoY PARK ;
BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: JIMA
BUCHANAN Ejdl/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUILDING b PROPERTY
L STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING
ADMIN BUILDING
EB:’L%?&ON SECOND FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-101-1

11 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

o
=
7]
. KEY NOTES FOR
p207] | I RADIOLOGY RADIOLOGY CONTRACTOR TO PROVIDE SMOKE
® ® © [e2ts | ECHANICAL provioe o) smore perecrors as ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:
S » TREATWENT TRIAGE . DENTAL LAB . ® PER EXISTING CONDITIONS. SMOKE
s o % ® MERCENCY i Tes ] ® o DETECTORS IN TUNNEL SHALL BE 1] LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
5] pets ® ' CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
B223
] — . % (B % BEZE ® ol NETWORK CONNECTIVITY. FSC INC.
" ® LOCKERS ® STORAGE & ENGINEERS, LLC
® a1 ¥, o ] DR ) WK 5 '2)IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT - <
. 3° ® 27 © E © ® P MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH 8675 W 96TH STREET
210 - e WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR O e o 0212
CLE OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL EAX: 913792 3484
s, WRE SOV () e | BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
. - ' | ol CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
® 1 ® CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
® AR ® e CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
EXAM
[F] "y . & ® 5 OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.
-BZOW
0 VED.DIR CORR. _ . (3) PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
comnnor c} » <. ] 5 Loz ' KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION
FLEe T OFFICE SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE
CART STORGE & N —— Loz | ees ) (o ALARM SYSTEM.
NURSING BLOOD DRAW fi( L1 g
O () ® [ 5206 ] PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
\1?5/ ‘ZKT” ELEVATOR ® ® ’% ® ® @ CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
A | B252 e e —
s ] X, ® s : & MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND —_— >
[o] SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
MEDICAL 25201
— L (5] MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
I jPERSONNEL P OFHCER [ B258 | [ B2%5 | OCCUPIABLE OFFICE OF
S| s ADMINISTRATION
= = ] | [ (6)EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS DIVISION OF FACILITIES
ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL MANAGEMENT
REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL )
FAT0T-2 FATO1-2 MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN. DESIGN AND
FAT01-3 FATOT=3 CONSTRUCTION

GENERAL NOTES:

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR

ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS. Multiple Assets
1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 WESTERN RECEPTION AND
SCALE: 3/32"=1-0° DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING

ILS 0
1 REVISION: 100% BID SET
BUILDING DATE:  05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
R REVISION:
CENTE .
BU\\—D‘“G B ARK DATE:
BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: JMA
BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUILDING b PROPERTY
I STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING
ADMIN BUILDING
EDUCATION SECOND FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-101-2

KEY PLAN

12 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

KEY NOTES FOR
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

FA101-2 FA101-2 (1) LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
M01-3 003 CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
s NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.
® ©® [2)IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
} ® ® [ MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
] & | WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
] ® OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
" BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
' CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
N CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
. CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
& [eX20 OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.
AHU-10
3)PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
p— KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION FSC INC
@ ©lc] SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE )
i ALARM SYSTEM. \__ENGINEERS,LLC )
] @ CORRIDOR CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL 8675 W 96TH STREET
CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL MUSE 203 | Lczos | [ ] [co] [c2o7 ] [coos ) [} [ czio @ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
[c276 | [c277 ] [c278 | [ce7a |  [c80 | [ cz81 | [ c282 | [ 283 . CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO P?&ng1g17623333223
® MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND :913.722.
®,8, ®,0, ®,®, ®,0, AHU-9 ®,®, ®,®, ®,0, ©,0, SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
coUpiET G 5) MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
®, @ %D OCCUPIABLE
®,
L AHUS s '8) EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
® ® AHUAT ® ® REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
PR & % ® % ey - MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.
cswwzg‘w > @ O % @ 75 ® cfi71 BELO) ® L
WING D R
2 5 S ? o) GENERAL NOTES:
CELL ’ CELL SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
C214 T ey —
% ® % 0 5 10 20
[*] o ® . S 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
CELL [¢] & MECHANICAL CELL DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
D
e:o c27 ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
® D 5 ®, DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS. OFFICE OF
: UPPER @, ADMINISTRATION
CELL DAYROOM UPPER
ooy ® @% @ OO @ ATROoH it DIVISION OF FACILITIES
® ® & et @ ® MANAGEMENT,
® DESIGN AND
6 A = 4" SQUARE JUNCTION BOX CONSTRUCTION
2 i @ ® 2 3/4" CONDUIT DOWN
TO LOWER CELL DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
@0, @0, @0, @0, VEST @, @0, @0, BION 3/4" FLEX WITH (IjOWER .
. INTERFACE LOOP TO SD CELL AREA Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
ON EACH SIDE OF CHASE :
Tows] | [omi]  [os] [ese]  [owr] [oeo] [cme]  [Go © ® o] Com] (o] [ow] [as] (o] [ ) Multiple Assets
4"x1-1/2" DEEP BOX MOUNT TO ~— EXHAUST
BACK OF ACCESS DOOR AIR WESTERN RECEPTION AND
CWDEFFEBOEEORL% oATROON ACCESS DOOR DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CELL WG 6] (2) T e EXHAUST AIR BOOT CENTER
® ® ° (BY DIVISION 15)
®, ®, NOTE: 3401 FARAON ST.
FOR INFORMATION ONLY. DETAIL PROVIDED BY DOC FROM EXISTING FIRE@ ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
ALARM DOCUMENTATION. TYPICAL FOR EACH CELL
el t10D{e] [#Kfr1o ceLL 2 CELL SMOKE DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAIL PROJECT # (232501
Z ® @ 3 SCALE: NTS SITE # 7012
. ®, @, ASSET # 9327012063
CELL
[[c234 ] MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
el o ILS) | REVISION: 100% BID SET
BUILDING DATE: __ 05/14/2025
@ o) REVISION:
° @, DATE:
CELL ©, CELL R REVISION:
cENT G DATE:
guno PARK '
® ® BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
o oo
4 ® CAD DWG FILE: FSC
8 ¢ DRAYNRY, —
CELL ° ? CELL :
BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: JFl\é[é
BUILDING b PROPERTY
00 o 00 o0 ! STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
=% 7 =% =% BUILDING
PROVIDE TWO DUCT MOUNTED SMOKE
DETECTORS WITH WEATHER PROOF HOUSING, CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL AD M I N BU I LD I N G
ONE PER CELL (TYPICAL FOR ALL HOUSING UNITS) c248 | [ c247 | [ co46 | [ca45 | [ ce42 | [co41 | [ cz40 | [ c239 EDUCATION SECOND FLOOR
ON ALL FLOORS WITH THIS CONFIGURATION. SEE BUILDING
:Zl)\lI?:TOAéII_\Ai?IIEI);A—ZOO FOR ADDITIONAL FI RE ALARM PLAN
PART-3
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-101-3

1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-3

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

KEY PLAN

13 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE

MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE

MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE

UPPER
DAYROOM

CB47 BELO}

UPPER
DAYROOM

Cp46 BELO)

MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE

75 gN

&

MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE

1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR MEZZANINE FIRE ALARM PLAN

MECHANICAL
UPPER N MEZZANINE

MECHANICAL

MULTI-PURPOSE [eX] 75 €287
STAR D
UPPER
DAYROOM
cli71 BELO
UPPER
DAYROOM
cfi71 BELO
E N
75
MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE
MEZZANINE
oo €290

MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE

MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE

.
sbe)

PN
N/

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

7

<

AN

KEY NOTES FOR

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.

@ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION
SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE
ALARM SYSTEM.

@ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

@ MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
OCCUPIABLE

@ EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.

MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE

GENERAL NOTES:
1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS.
MECHANICAL
MEZZANINE

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING
BUILDING L —— PROPERTY

L STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

N\ J
8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484
SCALE: 3/32'=1-0" (IN FEET)
e e —
0 5 10 20
OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE:
REVISION:

DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

ADMIN BUILDING
SECOND FLOOR
MEZZANINE

FIRE ALARM PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-101-4

14 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



e STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

=K

© ® KEY NOTES FOR
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

\‘@
3
z

O]
1) LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
® ® CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.
(2JIN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
o MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
® @ ® o ® WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
opu s OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
| BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET PROFESSIONAL SEAL
22 CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
==z CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
| ® ® ® ® ® @ CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
o cerecron | 0 OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.
WIRE CAGE GUARDS ARE @ K<<>
WITH NEW EGUIPMENT. w | (3) PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
g | . G 5 KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION FSC INC.
Ppm— | X =, SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE ENGINEERS. LLC
o Sl e © suner ALARM SYSTEM. - : y,
% i:J | b3 & ﬂ ® wroen @ ® = w.  ® ® 8675 W 96TH STREET
® | " @ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
o g CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO PHONE: 816.33.4373
CE 3 MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND FAX: 913.722.3484
P | E SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS,
| i Eh i (5] MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
CONTROL e N ® ® ® RECEIVING
X 1obfS) oy ® o . . . B OCCUPIABLE
#Krs
® | e o “M (6) EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
- e &l N ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
E R I = * A REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
| _ "M X MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.
I ©SALLYPORT K% 30@\ INMATE BREAK @ @ REFRIGERATED REFRIGERATED REFRIGERATED @
Do || Coso ® e @ S e
15 | . £ GENERAL NOTES: o
Q&.« %N UTSH 15 SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0 (IN FEET)
VIDEO © | 15 @ \ GENERAL 0 5 10’ 20’
& i Y - 2 o) 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
Si2 wing o ” DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
T — ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
FA102-1 FA02- DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS. OFFICE OF

E L T T > - - - - """ " " " Y T - T~ s o ADMINISTRATION
| 7 DIVISION OF FACILITIES
| g MANAGEMENT,
| DESIGN AND

| CONSTRUCTION

|

|
|

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

DINING
Replace Fire Alarm Panels
. HC. o
- . - - - - - e STOR. MUL-%)SE et \ Gt | \ 606 | G306 | G | s | o8 | 0 | oo | Multlple Assets
[[c352 ] [c353 ] [ ¢354 | [ c355 | [[c356 ] [c3s7 ] [ c358 ] [c%o ]
.0, .0, .0, .0, ®.0, .0, ®.0, .9,
WESTERN RECEPTION AND
-C362
e 2 o3 DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
D SECURE D
o o s CENTER
DAYROOM DAYROOM
N N 3401 FARAON ST.
% % ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
SECURE © N SECURE S;Lé
15,84
L PROJECT # (232501
=
z SITE # 7012

P

ST ASSET # 9327012063

P e
. @ e %N MAINTENANCE
¢ ” N BUILDING
® A
®, STORAGE ®, ILS . 0
n N BUILDING ° REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
\. \V e, Er: Cr) o0, oo, ®®, REVII)S,L%::I:
PROVIDE TWO DUCT MOUNTED @ 7N SHONERS STORAGE H.C. R REVISION.
SMOKE DETECTORS WITH WEATHER il CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL G C332A SHOWERS €330 G CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL .
PROOF HOUSING, ONE PER CELL [As41 ] [c340 | [c339 | [c338 ] [c337 ] [c3%6 | [c33% | @ [c334 | [Lc331A | [caz8 | [c327 |  [c326 | [ c325 | [cs24 | [cs25 | [ o322 CENTE DATE:
(TYPICAL FOR ALL HOUSING UNITS) D\NG .
ON ALL FLOORS WITH THIS gu\L PARK
CoeToN S b o BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
INFORMATION. (3328 ] [c5a]
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: IMA
® ® BUCHANAN qul/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUILDING b PROPERTY
Chines] Chiner] ! STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
‘ BUILDING

e ® 5 A ADMIN BUILDING
- I b EDUCATION THIRD FLOOR

BUILDING

AUl FIRE ALARM PLAN

T
® ® e —
ADMIN

BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:

¢ ¢ FA-102
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN s .

SCALE: 1/16" = 1'-0"

15 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



SMOKE DETECTORS WITH
WIRE CAGE GUARDS ARE
EXISTING TO BE REPLACED
WITH NEW EQUIPMENT. WP

FA102-1

FA102-2

=
CONFERENCE @ [STAR A]
STFQE{)&UT CAPTAIN OFFICE INV 1
L (Bl @) ML TLT @ye A310 A311
5N | A3?53 ‘15“04 | Aatﬁ ‘ 5N VESTIBULE
% X 4 4 ¥ % WAITING
' ' '
@ 30-+’§ _ a0
INVATE ' SECRETARY
A319 ]
|
ng
CONTROL 15'\\‘.,_|
[eK]110 1o0[{e] AT SA%:}SRT o ®[sAR B
15
©)] —
VISITATION N s
R o] @ ©
ANN
15
@ &,
@ 15
VIDEQ
COURT 1'5+): VISITOR'S — Y ® ,
N WAITING ROOM | JSIToRS.
% % A319
FAT02-1
FA102-3
1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

KEY NOTES FOR

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.

@ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION
SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE
ALARM SYSTEM.

@ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

@ MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
OCCUPIABLE

@ EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS.

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

Ej/ BUILDING
- PROPERTY

L STORAGE
BUILDING

BUCHANAN
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

N\ J
8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484
SCALE: 3/32'=1-0" (IN FEET)
e e —
0 5 10 20
OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE:
REVISION:

DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

ADMIN BUILDING
THIRD FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-102-1

16 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



KEY NOTES FOR

=
Il ¢
® ®
75 N
®
TRAY WASH
® ®©
@ ® ®©n ® DINING HALL ®
313
DINING HALL
~ [@aN
SRR
[ ()
= ! =
L L
® ® @
& ?
K
<«
135N 135N
@ STOR.
75 B316 N
R 15
OFFICE INV_1 @
A310 A3 STORAGE
KITCHEN FREEZER FREEZER
[mu] N STOR
B317
SECRETARY
NEN @ INV.CLERK
a B318
[mm] DRY_STORAGE FOOD SERVICE
% " ® ® RECENG
7N D
@[ 5] ® POTS/PAN WASH WP
h-mm F [eX7s
: @ b @ K K
[ )
= K —DM DOCK
e ®we
¢ LM CART WASH CART STORAGE R A
l\15 N
ST ® ® @ SUPERVISOR -
A316 | MT. ® z
o »
15,84 15,04
— TRASH CAN_ WASH
® K§ ® ® [ 8322 ] ® [ B321 |
SALLYPORT 30 3@ INMATE BREAK REFRIGERATED REFRIGERATED REFRIGERATED
e Oue " cors, ® R o
T ’ MANAGER
UTENSIL WASH T s N SRS
Q%N
15
@" GENERAL
— ® STORAGE \ ELEC |§| RECEVING
Ll VISITOR'S A318 y
| CORRIDOR 30
SIS WAITING ROOM CORRIDOR
==
[y K
FA102-2 -
FA102-2
FA102-3 SERVING . FA102-3
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -
1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"
BUCHANAN

BUILDING

ADMINISTRATION BUILDINC

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.

@ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION
SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE
ALARM SYSTEM.

@ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

@ MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
OCCUPIABLE

@ EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS.

PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

Ej/ BUILDING
- PROPERTY

L STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION

BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

J

.

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE.:
REVISION:

DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
SHEET TITLE:
ADMIN BUILDING -
THIRD FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
SHEET NUMBER:
FA-102-2

17 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



~

FA102-

FA102-2

STORAGE

A318

CORRIDOR 30

KEY NOTES FOR
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

CELL
C351

CELL
€350

CELL
C349

CELL
C348

CELL
C345

CELL
C344

CELL
C343

CELL
C342

PROVIDE TWO DUCT MOUNTED

SMOKE DETECTORS WITH WEATHER

PROOF HOUSING, ONE PER CELL
(TYPICAL FOR ALL HOUSING UNITS)
ON ALL FLOORS WITH THIS
CONFIGURATION. SEE DETAIL 2 ON
FA-200 FOR ADDITIONAL
INFORMATION.

CELL

[ c35% |

O

(O

o

o

H.C.
CELL

DAYROOM

C347

WING |

DAYROOM

C346

WING H

®

H.C.

CELL
[ 337 ]

CELL
[ c334 |

MULTI-PURPOSE

SECURE
CORRIDOR

SHOWERS

[ c331A

DAYROOM

C143

WING F

®

TOILETS
3318 |

®

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-3

H.C
CELL

CELL CELL CELL CELL
[ c304 | [ c305 | [ c306 | [ ¢307 | [ c308 ]

CELL ELL
[ c30 | [ c3nn |

©D©D ©D©D
DAYROOM
€316
WING D @
DAYROOM
317
WING E | [2)
®®, @0,

H.C.
CELL

O

O

O

O

CELL CELL CELL

[ c328 | [ c327 | [ 326 |

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.

@ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION
SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE
ALARM SYSTEM.

@ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

CELL
C312

(5) MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
OCCUPIABLE
CELL
=l (6) EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
CELL MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.

C314

CELL GENERAL NOTES:

C315

- 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE

c318 DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS.

CELL
C319

CELL

CELL

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING

ILS

BUILDING -

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING
BUILDING L —— PROPERTY

L STORAGE

ﬁ\\ BUILDING

e W EDUCATION
ADMIN

BUILDING
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

J

.

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

ADMIN BUILDING
THIRD FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-3

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-102-3

18 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



CE

CELL

c CELL CELL
[ c452 | [ c453 | [ c454 ]

CELL CELL CELL LL
[ c455 | [ c456 ] [ c457 | | [ c458

C459

©D ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D ©D
L MECHANICAL
4
D
@,
CELL
UPPER
® DAYROOM
CELL @ Q&EA\
@
@,
®,
CELL
%
CELL @
UPPER
@, DAYROOM
170A
CELL ®, @ WING H
®
®
CELL
%D STORAGE
°
CELL
©D@D ©D©D @D@D
CELL
CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL CELL
c441 | [ c440 | [ c439 | [[c437 | [ c436 | [ c4a35 ] ©
@
PROVIDE TWO DUCT MOUNTED
SMOKE DETECTORS WITH WEATHER
PROOF HOUSING, ONE PER CELL
(TYPICAL FOR ALL HOUSING UNITS)
ON ALL FLOORS WITH THIS
CONFIGURATION. SEE DETAIL 2 ON
FA-200 FOR ADDITIONAL UPPER
INFORMATION. DAYROOM
2 144A
WING G
®
CUBICLES
@
CUBICLES

UPPER_DINING ROOM

ooz BeLOl

110)@]] [oK]i10

UPPER MULTI-PURPOSE

UPPER
DAYROOM

143A

WING

F

CUBICLES

C431B

STORAGE

®

VESTIBULE

STORAGE

CUBICLES

[cesin ]

- ¥
/75\ N

®
o

MECHANICAL

® [0 ] ®

@
& &

I —

(]

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - PENTHOUSE FIRE ALARM PLAN

KEY NOTES FOR
ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:
1JLOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE

CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.

@ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR

2 SCALE: 3/32" = 1'-0" WO@f KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION
4 SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE
ALARM SYSTEM.
(4] PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
R n el m il bl R el SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
(5) MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
®,0, ®,®, ®,®, ®,0, OCCUPIABLE
cELL (6) EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
N 412 ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
& REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
72— MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.
C413
® PPER ® GENERAL NOTES:
@) M@SAD CELL
C414
®, 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE
®, DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
L ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
5 DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS.
IZJ CELL
T 418
e 2
@ WKI(ZAE CELL
C419 4" SQUARE JUNCTION BOX
® ® 3/4" CONDUIT DOWN
TO LOWER CELL
(s ]
®, ) (’
& 3/4" FLEX WITH LOWER
CELL INTERFACE LOOP TO SD CELL AREA
ON EACH SIDE OF CHASE )
4"x1-1/2" DEEP BOX MOUNT TO —— EXHAUST
@D@D @D@D @D@D @D@D BACK OF ACCESS DOOR AlR
CELL
ACCESS DOOR
Toas ] [ ] | [cee]  [oas ] [cee] [oas] | [cem

EXHAUST AIR BOOT

(BY DIVISION 15)

NOTE:
FOR INFORMATION ONLY. DETAIL PROVIDED BY DOC FROM EXISTING FIRE
ALARM DOCUMENTATION. TYPICAL FOR EACH CELL

CELL SMOKE DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAIL

2 SCALE: NTS
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING °
{ER
C’EN()\NG
gu\L PARK
BUILDING
LAUNDRY
BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING
BUILDING L —— PROPERTY
i STORAGE
= BUILDING
= / \ EDUCATION
N SN BUILDING
.t ‘
ADMIN
BUILDING

1 ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

J

.

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (C232501
SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE:
REVISION:

DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
SHEET TITLE:

ADMIN BUILDING
FOURTH FLOOR &
PENTHOUSE

FIRE ALARM PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-103-1

19 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



)

MECHANICAL
CHASE

MECHANICAL
CHASE

MECHANICAL
CHASE

[ca9s ] (&)

UPPER
DAYROOM

che7 oeL

UPPER
DAYROOM

cp46 BELO)

MECHANICAL
CHASE

&) [osse |

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR MEZZANINE FIRE ALARM PLAN

UPPER
MECHANICAL

cl60 BELO
UPPER
STORAGE
Cl33 BELO
MECHANICAL
CHASE
495
UPPER
DINING ROOM
cf32 BELO
MECHANICAL
CHASE
c494 ] (5]
MECHANICAL
CHASE
493 [:j

MECHANICAL
CHASE

3
UPPER
DAYROOM
Cl316 BELO
UPPER
DAYROOM
cp17 BELO)
UPPER
STORAGE
ch30_BELQ
e s
@
UPPER
DINING ROOM
cp31_BELD
NOTE: PLAN SHOWN FOR
INFORMATION ONLY. NO
FIRE ALARM DEVICES
REQUIRED AT THIS LEVEL.
MECHANICAL
CHASE
®
MECHANICAL
CHASE

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

KEY NOTES FOR

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ IN HOUSING UNITS REPLACE DUCT
MOUNTED SMOKE DETECTOR WITH
WEATHER PROOF SMOKE DETECTOR
OR DUCT DETECTOR. WIRING SHALL
BE PLENUM AND RATED FOR WET
CONDITIONS OR PROVIDE ROUTING IN
CONDUIT WITH LIQUID TIGHT FLEX
CONNECTIONS TO AVOID DAMAGE IF
OFFENDER FLOODS CELL AND CHASE.

@ PROVIDE MONITOR MODULE FOR
KITCHEN HOOD SUPPRESSION
SYSTEM MONITORING BY THE FIRE
ALARM SYSTEM.

@ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

@ MECHANICAL CRAWLSPACE - NOT
OCCUPIABLE

@ EACH AHU HAS TWO CONTROLLERS
ASSUME EACH DUCT DETECTOR WILL
REQUIRE A SEPARATE CONTROL
MODULE FOR FAN SHUTDOWN.

GENERAL NOTES:

MECHANICAL
CHASE

(&) 1. REFER TO DETAIL OF CELL SMOKE

DETECTOR INSTALLATION FOR
ORIGINAL MOUNTED SMOKE
DETECTOR INSTALLATION DETAILS.

MECHANICAL
CHASE

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING
BUILDING L —— PROPERTY

L STORAGE
\\ BUILDING

/ \ EDUCATION
2N BUILDING
ADMIN

BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

J

.

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE:
REVISION:

DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

ADMIN BUILDING
FOURTH FLOOR
MEZZANINE

FIRE ALARM PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-103-2

20 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STAIR
1134

@ DgRM
ROOM
K
o0 5
@&@
DORM
ROOM
DORM
ROOM
1114
DORM
ROOH
DoRM ~o 15
ROOM o
CORR DORM
ROOM
1194
FUTURE
ROOM
109 @
N
‘j STORAGE
@ NO SPRINKLERS PROVIDED SMOKE DETECTION
N REQUIRED.
: N @@ ° N STORAGE
o WS ®
S
SHOWER
DORM
ROOM
CHASE
DoRM
ROOM
\;./ 15
o
~@15  roLer
o
® wP
DORM
ROOM
DAYROOM
%
30
OFFICE
FA200-2 FA200-2
OFFICE
@

1 BUCHANAN BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 mm

SCALE: 3/32"= 10" NORTH

KEY NOTES FOR
BUCHANAN BUILDING:

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE DUE TO
NFPA 72 DB REQUIREMENTS AND
ANTICIPATED AMBIENT SOUND LEVELS.

@ RELOCATED DEVICE TO MEET
COVERAGE REQUIREMENTS OF NFPA 72.

@ LOCATION OF FACU, FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS.
THE BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED.
TO MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING
SLEEPING SPACES.

2. EACH WING AND LEVEL OF THE BUILDING
HAS A MECHANICAL ROOM. FOR BIDDING
PURPOSES, PROVIDE MINIMUM OF ONE
DUCT DETECTOR, ONE SMOKE DETECTOR
AND THE REQUIRED CONTROL MODULE
(S) FOR AHU SHUTDOWN.

3. DOORS EXIST WHERE DOOR HOLDS ARE
SHOWN. PROVIDE DOOR HOLDS FOR
DOORS LOCATED WITHIN THE
RESIDENTIAL WING HALLWAYS SERVING
THE FROM AREAS. THE DISTANCE
BETWEEN THE DOORHEADER AND
CEILING WAS OBSERVED TO BE LESS
THAN 12 INCHES.

4. FIELD LOCATE AND PROVIDE ONE
TAMPER AND ONE FLOW SWITCH ON THE
SPRINKLER MAIN SERVING EACH FLOOR
LEVEL.

5. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING
TO ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH
WILL ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER
ZONE.

6. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE
OF RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR
HOLDS ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE
DETECTOR FOR ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT
OF THE DOOR THEY SERVE PER NFPA 72.

7. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS

NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR
RECALL AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING

ILS

BUILDING °
CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING
LAUNDRY
BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING
BU'LD'NG\“T L PROPERTY
) i STORAGE
A ﬁ\ BUILDING
i
& EDUCATION
\ BUILDING
ADMIN
BUILDING

KEY PLAN

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

BUCHANAN BUILDING
FIRST FLOOR

FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-200-1

21 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



KEY NOTES FOR STATE OF MISSOURI
BUCHANAN BUILDING: MIKE KEHOE,

GOVERNOR
@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE DUE TO
NFPA 72 DB REQUIREMENTS AND
ANTICIPATED AMBIENT SOUND LEVELS.

@ RELOCATED DEVICE TO MEET
FA200-1 FA200-1 COVERAGE REQUIREMENTS OF NFPA 72.

FA200-2 £A200-7 3JLOCATION OF FACU, FACU SHALL BE
@ CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

STORAGE

15R;.€| K MEDICAL =
GENERAL NOTES:
s ® % 1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS.
v THE BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED.
] TO MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF

15

® ® = ® PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
tﬂ5w© o 5 4 DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY F SC | N C
75 8 ® ROOMS AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING -
SLEEPING SPACES. (__ENGINEERS, LLC )
orricE — ® 8675 W 96TH STREET
= 2. EACH WING AND LEVEL OF THE BUILDING OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
® ® [eK7 HAS A MECHANICAL ROOM. FOR BIDDING PHONE: 816.33 4373
B, g o PURPOSES, PROVIDE MINIMUM OF ONE FAX. 913.722.3484
2 T ¥ DUCT DETECTOR, ONE SMOKE DETECTOR
Pl s AND THE REQUIRED CONTROL MODULE

(S) FOR AHU SHUTDOWN.

B

® 3. DOORS EXIST WHERE DOOR HOLDS ARE
SHOWN. PROVIDE DOOR HOLDS FOR
. A ® DOORS LOCATED WITHIN THE
@ RESIDENTIAL WING HALLWAYS SERVING
® THE FROM AREAS. THE DISTANCE
BETWEEN THE DOORHEADER AND
CEILING WAS OBSERVED TO BE LESS

©) THAN 12 INCHES. SCALE: 3/32"=1-0" (IN FEET)
™ ey —
4. FIELD LOCATE AND PROVIDE ONE 0 5 10 20
% TAMPER AND ONE FLOW SWITCH ON THE
[ SPRINKLER MAIN SERVING EACH FLOOR
LEVEL. OFFICE OF
Heis . FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER ADMINISTRATION
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING DIVISION OF FACILITIES
TO ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH MANAGEMENT,
@ g \évcl)%\lLEACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER DESIGN AND
' CONSTRUCTION
6. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
w NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
OF RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR
HOLDS ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE
DETECTOR FOR ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT .
2 - OF THE DOOR THEY SERVE PER NFPA 72. Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
G o Multiple Assets
® o 7. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
N
eorssiouansevror [ WesTERN RECEPTION AND
® o DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER
® g 3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
PROJECT # (232501
L. SITE # 7012
-~ 15
ASSET # 9327012063
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
SUILDIGa REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE:  05/14/2025
s REVISION:
- /© DATE:
REVISION:
gNTER :
Bc\'g\\.D‘“G PARK DATE:
. BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
[5
CAD DWG FILE; FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: JIMA
BUCHANAN -~ BUIDNG DESIGNED BY: FSC
. —— ' PROPERTY
/J I STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
Beh ﬁ\ BUILDING
/ a6 BUCHANAN BUILDING
g 2 : EDUCATION FIRST FLOOR
] FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
BUCHANAN BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 .|II|||||||I||II|. ADMIN
1 SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" i y BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-200-2

22 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STAIR
213A

KEY NOTES FOR
BUCHANAN BUILDING:

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE DUE TO
NFPA 72 DB REQUIREMENTS AND
ANTICIPATED AMBIENT SOUND LEVELS.

@ RELOCATED DEVICE TO MEET
COVERAGE REQUIREMENTS OF NFPA 72.

@ LOCATION OF FACU, FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS.
THE BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED.
TO MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF

STORAGE

[211¢]
STAIR

212A

STORAGE

210C @
kLF]
DORM @
ROOM
DORM
ROOM
15 @2
8
DORM.
ROOM
216C
CORR
JO
MECH
ROOM
@V
\ 15
®

PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING
SLEEPING SPACES.

. EACH WING AND LEVEL OF THE BUILDING

HAS A MECHANICAL ROOM. FOR BIDDING
PURPOSES, PROVIDE MINIMUM OF ONE
DUCT DETECTOR, ONE SMOKE DETECTOR
AND THE REQUIRED CONTROL MODULE
(S) FOR AHU SHUTDOWN.

. DOORS EXIST WHERE DOOR HOLDS ARE

SHOWN. PROVIDE DOOR HOLDS FOR
DOORS LOCATED WITHIN THE
RESIDENTIAL WING HALLWAYS SERVING
THE FROM AREAS. THE DISTANCE
BETWEEN THE DOORHEADER AND
CEILING WAS OBSERVED TO BE LESS
THAN 12 INCHES.

. FIELD LOCATE AND PROVIDE ONE

TAMPER AND ONE FLOW SWITCH ON THE
SPRINKLER MAIN SERVING EACH FLOOR
LEVEL.

. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER

VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING
TO ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH
WILL ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER

5 @,

@ Q0RM
K ROOM
214/
DORM
ROOH
2124 15
R
@ DORM
ROOM
2154
DORY
ROOM
2114
DORM
ROOM
2164
DORM
ROOW
2104
DORY
ROOM
15 (2174)
o
Futme CoRR
2094 2184 @
N SIORAGE
@ 2194
\
@
N
@ N 15 STORAGE
MECH 15% 2208
ROOM
2084 x
4
217
DORM
ROOM
207A CHASE
DM SHOWER 223
2224 P
/
2 /
<
2064 \\»/.\15
@'
P/15
8.
WP TOLET
DORN 224
ROOM
2054
DAYROOM
201/ >
OFFICE
OFFICE 2024
2054
N/
SE
r=rh K

1 BUCHANAN BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 mm

N

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

ZONE.

6. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE
OF RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR
HOLDS ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE
DETECTOR FOR ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT
OF THE DOOR THEY SERVE PER NFPA 72.

7. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR
RECALL AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING
BU'LD'NG\% . —— ' PROPERTY

L STORAGE

\ Ui ) BUILDING
S
//J %
S
]

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

KEY PLAN

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

N\ J
8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484
SCALE: 3/32'=1-0" (IN FEET)
e e —
0 5 10 20
OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

BUCHANAN BUILDING
SECOND FLOOR

FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-201-1

23 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
KEY NOTES FOR MIKE KEHOE,

BUCHANAN BUILDING: GOVERNOR
@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE

REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE DUE TO
NFPA 72 DB REQUIREMENTS AND

@ ( ANTICIPATED AMBIENT SOUND LEVELS.
FA201-1 FA201-1
KL
< (2) RELOCATED DEVICE TO MEET
FA201-2 ; FA201-2 COVERAGE REQUIREMENTS OF NFPA 72.
vl NE NV 15,\ \’
© LS © 3] LOCATION OF FACU, FACU SHALL BE
g il CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
K NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.
Lotk
®. 532
‘© GENERAL NOTES:
1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
3 HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS.
7, THE BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED.
[Xre TO MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY FSC INC.
. ROOMS AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING ENGINEERS. LLC
e SLEEPING SPACES. _ : y,
wp 8675 W 96TH STREET
B gty e 2. EACH WING AND LEVEL OF THE BUILDING OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
Rl HAS A MECHANICAL ROOM. FOR BIDDING PHONE: 816.33.4373
o PURPOSES, PROVIDE MINIMUM OF ONE FAX: 913.722.3484
DUCT DETECTOR, ONE SMOKE DETECTOR
® AND THE REQUIRED CONTROL MODULE
(S) FOR AHU SHUTDOWN.
3. DOORS EXIST WHERE DOOR HOLDS ARE
SHOWN. PROVIDE DOOR HOLDS FOR
DOORS LOCATED WITHIN THE
RESIDENTIAL WING HALLWAYS SERVING
THE FROM AREAS. THE DISTANCE
S ® BETWEEN THE DOORHEADER AND
CEILING WAS OBSERVED TO BE LESS
THAN 12 INCHES. SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
30 e T —
5 4. FIELD LOCATE AND PROVIDE ONE 0 > 1o 20
TAMPER AND ONE FLOW SWITCH ON THE
- SPRINKLER MAIN SERVING EACH FLOOR
LEVEL. OFFICE OF
® 5. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER ADMINISTRATION
9 P VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING DIVISION OF FACILITIES
s | TO ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH MANAGEMENT,
3 WILL ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER DESIGN AND
ZONE. CONSTRUCTION
e 6. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
OF RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR
® HOLDS ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE
& DETECTOR FOR ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT | o Al |
] i OF THE DOOR THEY SERVE PER NFPA 72. Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
"o ey.s Multiple Assets
7. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
L S o™ NECESSARY TO NANTAN ELEVATOR WESTERN RECEPTION AND
% - | DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER
®
o, 3401 FARAON ST.
- a ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
o PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
MAINTENANCE
ooy BUILDING
ILS . 0
B @g@ BUILDING ° REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: _ 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
o NTER REVISION:
1 Bc\ﬁ\.o““e PARK DATE:
BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: IMA
BUCHANAN qul/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUILDING .~ PROPERTY
/] I STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
B BUILDING
{ \BUCHANAN BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 mm / BUCHANAN BUILDING
SR ST NG SECOND FLOOR
BUILDING
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-201-2

24 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



KEY NOTES FOR STATE OF MISSOURI
BUCHANAN BUILDING: MIKE KEHOE,

GOVERNOR
@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE DUE TO
NFPA 72 DB REQUIREMENTS AND
ANTICIPATED AMBIENT SOUND LEVELS.

@ RELOCATED DEVICE TO MEET
COVERAGE REQUIREMENTS OF NFPA 72.

@ LOCATION OF FACU, FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS.
THE BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED.
TO MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE

DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING FSC INC.
. SLEEPING SPACES. \__ ENGINEERS,LLC )
8675 W 96TH STREET
@\ 2. EACH WING AND LEVEL OF THE BUILDING OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
—q K J HAS A MECHANICAL ROOM. FOR BIDDING PHONE: 816.33.4373
\\ ) 15 PURPOSES, PROVIDE MINIMUM OF ONE FAX: 913.722.3484
\\ A DUCT DETECTOR, ONE SMOKE DETECTOR
AND THE REQUIRED CONTROL MODULE
s . ® (S) FOR AHU SHUTDOWN.
@Q @ o DORM
3. DOORS EXIST WHERE DOOR HOLDS ARE
\\ J SHOWN. PROVIDE DOOR HOLDS FOR
\\ // DOORS LOCATED WITHIN THE
RESIDENTIAL WING HALLWAYS SERVING
// THE FROM AREAS. THE DISTANCE
// BETWEEN THE DOORHEADER AND
\\ - CEILING WAS OBSERVED TO BE LESS
\\ THAN 12 INCHES. SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
. i e e —
\\ My 4. FIELD LOCATE AND PROVIDE ONE o 5 10 20
as TAMPER AND ONE FLOW SWITCH ON THE
\ ® ® // SPRINKLER MAIN SERVING EACH FLOOR
\ 2 // LEVEL. OFFICE OF
pr STORAGE f
5 — — by 5. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER ADMINISTRATION
@ \\ /] | VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING DIVISION OF FACILITIES
N — & ® By m ® TO ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH MANAGEMENT,
© v@% ® e / // N WILL ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER DESIGN AND
wech @ MECH Z NE
5 \ / © CONSTRUCTION
E N T 6. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
£ // NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
\\ \ // OF RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR
i} il - HOLDS ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE
[ ® J DETECTOR FOR ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT ,
\\ ~ - OF THE DOOR THEY SERVE PER NFPA 72. Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
i q I Multiple Assets
s I 7. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
@ e ey NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR
s J RECALL AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS. WESTERN RECEPTION AND
N I DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER
- ® @ 3401 FARAON ST.
% ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
©) PROJECT # (232501
. SITE # 7012
@ ASSET # 9327012063
MAINTENANCE
FA202-1 FA202-1 s BUILDING
. 0
A BUILDING REVISION: 100% BID SET
FA207=7 FA209 -9 DATE:  05/14/2025
@ REVISION:
SE W\ smmg\ @ /Q@E DATE :
CENTER REVISION:
BU\\—D\NG bARK DATE:
BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
1 BUCHANAN BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" NORTH
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: IMA
BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BU'LD'NG\* e | b PROPERTY
N I STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
, Wi ﬁ\\ BUILDING
! L BUCHANAN BUILDING
< ' EDUCATION THIRD FLOOR
/ FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-202-1

25 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



KEY NOTES FOR STATE OF MISSOURI

_ MIKE KEHOE,
BUCHANAN BUILDING: GOVERNOR

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE DUE TO
NFPA 72 DB REQUIREMENTS AND
ANTICIPATED AMBIENT SOUND LEVELS.

@ RELOCATED DEVICE TO MEET
COVERAGE REQUIREMENTS OF NFPA 72.

FA207-1 FA20)—1 @ LOCATION OF FACU, FACU SHALL BE
] o CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR

NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.
FA202-2 FA202-2

= e °/ GENERAL NOTES:

302C obrice

A 5030
\\ Ny ;l‘p., I 1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
e — 15 HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS.
THE BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED.
H TO MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
H PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE

— — o — H DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY FSC |NC

| o ® ROOMS AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING CNGINEERS LLe
Gk °® & ® @ “m SLEEPING SPACES. N , J

- sp{e] 8675 W 96TH STREET
N Peumse 2. EACH WING AND LEVEL OF THE BUILDING OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212

® H HAS A MECHANICAL ROOM. FOR BIDDING PHONE: 816.33.4373
PURPOSES, PROVIDE MINIMUM OF ONE FAX:913.722.3484
DUCT DETECTOR, ONE SMOKE DETECTOR
AND THE REQUIRED CONTROL MODULE
(S) FOR AHU SHUTDOWN.

LASS
kOO RO0M 5
FO1E N IHIE ‘ ‘ S0E]

@ ! SD‘E‘ TOLET ‘ ‘

OFFIC!
JI9E

LN 4N
[32iE] STAFF. STORAGE
TOLET ROOM
J23E 325E

=]

P

%
&3

7%

3. DOORS EXIST WHERE DOOR HOLDS ARE
SHOWN. PROVIDE DOOR HOLDS FOR
DOORS LOCATED WITHIN THE
RESIDENTIAL WING HALLWAYS SERVING
THE FROM AREAS. THE DISTANCE
BETWEEN THE DOORHEADER AND
CEILING WAS OBSERVED TO BE LESS
THAN 12 INCHES. SCALE: 3/32"=1-0" (IN FEET)

e e —

4. FIELD LOCATE AND PROVIDE ONE 0 g 10 20
TAMPER AND ONE FLOW SWITCH ON THE
SPRINKLER MAIN SERVING EACH FLOOR

LEVEL. OFFICE OF

5. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER ADMINISTRATION
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING DIVISION OF FACILITIES

oz TO ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH MANAGEMENT,
WILL ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER DESIGN AND

ZONE. CONSTRUCTION

6. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
OF RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR
HOLDS ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE
DETECTOR FOR ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT ,
OF THE DOOR THEY SERVE PER NFPA 72. Replace Fire Alarm Panels,

Multiple Assets

7. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR

RECALL AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS. WESTERN RECEPTION AND

DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

MAINTENANCE

BUILDING

ILS 0
/ REVISION: 100% BID SET
BUILDING DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
NTER

;()E\LD\NG DATE:

PARK
BUILDING ISSUE DATE:

1 BUCHANAN BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" NORTH CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS

LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: JIMA

BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUILDING b PROPERTY

. STORAGE SHEET TITLE:

BUILDING
BUCHANAN BUILDING
EDUCATION THIRD FLOOR
BUILDING
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
ADMIN

BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:

FA-202-2

26 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

@K
CENTER.
guno PARK
. BUILDING
4
w ‘J LT 2
v !
LAUNDRY
BUCHANAN [ﬂ/ BUILDING
BUILDING | —— ' PROPERTY
! STORAGE
BUILDING
_ o EDUCATION
o Le] BUILDING
15 15 N
ADMIN
BUILDING
g of
15 5 UTILITY CRAWLSPACE ® ®
%N 5 NO STORAGE, 3)
- L8 NO COMBUSTIBLES, NO
FA NECESSARY
®
OFFICE
BO2e
%N
P[P ‘el ®
090v0v0 %N STORAGE ® GAME ROOM @ %E w6
RISER ROOM N sop{e] [eKl7s BO22 [eXfio0
® ® ®
[ [ BRARY
17 SPACE @ Bo272
B0O19 ELECTRICAL NP OFFICE
30 BOP1 15 8 BOPS
X RESTROOM
B [BAS| [F]
Dle] &)
AN, @ GYMNAS TUM
£023 OFFICE
BOPIA
75
LA 30 N
N BO22A
®
® ® @
géli?/\f/gg% D ABANDONED W%WW 30
FA300-1 D | we[e] I FA300-1
'''''' WG
LB19
FA300-2 e FA300-2

| £

15 @4

CENTER BUILDING - BASEMENT FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

NORTH

KEY NOTES FOR

CENTER BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.

@ DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUCT
WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.

@ U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED
FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.

@ EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS
MAINTAINED.

(6) ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
CONNECTING SLEEPING SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE
SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL ACTIVATE
PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. ONE
FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD
BE PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

N\ J
8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484
SCALE: 3/32'=1-0" (IN FEET)
e e —
0 5 10 20
OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

CENTER BUILDING
BASEMENT FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-300-1

27 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



ABANDONED | 4 paNDONED
RESTROOM  RESTROOM

VIDED ROOM
BO34

FA300-1 wo [ Ko FA300-1
v
FA300-2 e FA300-2
/I\ N
— 15 @4 \
% 75 STAFF @
15 N RES TROOM
(F] Ei 59 B036
= ELO G [,
N 75 \ OFFICE
® ® ®@ = 2021
N STORAGE
BO31B
_ _ [eKls
k R
2 2 5 ®
%N
BASEMENT
TUNNEL
ACCESSIBLE
©
STORAGE
piodvy G
oDl A
REFERENCE SHEET
FA305 FOR
POWERHOUSE
BOILER ROOM PLANS/LAYOUT
OFFICE orrlce
L2003 L2003
N
15[{e]
%N
(HPLP]
> RISER
ROOM
DRY RISER
LOCATION
N
15[e]
RISER ROOM
RES TROOM
STORAGE
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING °
TER
C’END\NG
gu\L PARK
BUILDING
LAUNDRY
BUCHANAN li]/ BUILDING
BUILDING . ——— PROPERTY
: STORAGE
/\ BUILDING
(/ \ EDUCATION
\\/ ) BUILDING OFFICE
SN g
ADMIN
BUILDING

1

CENTER BUILDING - BASEMENT FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

NORTH

KEY NOTES FOR

CENTER BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.

@ DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUCT
WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.

@ U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED
FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.

@ EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS
MAINTAINED.

@ ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

—_—

. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
CONNECTING SLEEPING SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE
SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL ACTIVATE
PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. ONE
FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD
BE PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

N\ J
8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484
SCALE: 3/32'=1-0" (IN FEET)
e e —
0 5 10 20
OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

CENTER BUILDING
BASEMENT FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-300-2

28 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI

KEY NOTES FOR MIKE KEHOE,
CENTER BUILDING: GOVERNOR
1)LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
Gi;ﬁg'ﬁ.'fgﬂémﬁ CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
LS NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.
BUILDING °

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.

e ceﬂg\“;f}, 3)DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
seDs DA RO sul- ;ﬁﬁ_KDING UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUCT
4123 ® 2126 2205 2 WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.

@ U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED

B @ v L AUNDRY FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
| UG % i]/ O AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.
5 BUILDING
eDEee] s | _ F——— PROPERTY (5 EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
a1z =9 : SToRASE EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
L coee 7N COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
b2 b, ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS
- \ EDUCATION MAINTAINED. FSC INC.
® « , BUILDING | ENGINEERS,LLC |
® (6) ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS. SO
E igg BEDS OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
a2 ADMIN (7) CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC PHONE: 816.33 4373
BUILDING NOTIFICATION ON SITE. FAX: 913.722.3484
BEDS Z,j ;/SHUM FEDS
4120 o 4101 GENERAL NOTES:
KEY PLAN 1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
o . NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
4119 4102 THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
sroRace s PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
Sit i DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
® ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
CONNECTING SLEEPING SPACES. SCALE: 3/32°=10" (IN FEET)
e T —
I 4i0s 2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE o 5 10 20
4117 SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
o MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
G PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE, ONE OFFICE OF
FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD ADMINISTRATION
BE PROVIDED PER FLOOR. DIVISION OF FACILITIES
seps MANAGEMENT,
ats aloe 3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND DESIGN AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
® MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND CONSTRUCTION
s BEDS SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
a115 4107 DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
BEDS BEDS
ALt 4108 Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets
ﬂﬂﬂM
s sics WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
______ r=pfe] CENTER
- ®
B 3401 FARAON ST.
sTAIR B1 o I ® ® ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
A112 A110 WG we
® ®
o 7] we we PROJECT # (232501
DIRECTOR S =z -
g 3 B e s pze 3 SITE # 7012
- ® Jan SHOVER STAFF — g ASSET # 9327012063
B113 ® TOILETS §:104 BAREER <, g x
STALE Bl16 2118 15,0 @ ) STOR,
N LT £127
(;? ¥ B1/4 l (4)MUL TI-PURPOSE
15,04 J5 N ‘o’ i &
~ - o o il e REVISION: 100% BID SET
% CLOSET £ e 1 1 ® ®,, DATE: _ 05/14/2025
2102 g REVISION:
7 cozRraR DATE:
Evgg/;y st REVISION:
B108 ® ® ® ® ® DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
75 CORRIDOR
BI1O7 % B104 ava i _ B
[o] ) b ¥ % CAD DWG FILE: FSC
_ _ ’ 30 15 DRAWN BY: DD/SS
i : ® see pesreaoy @y @ CHECKED BY: IMA
<, TOILETS FREARRIIN ® DESIGNED BY: FSC
FA301-1 e ® S “ @ o nepIcaL ot SHEET TITLE
g;%z ; %ZP SHOWER RELLRDS WAITING . |
— LLUO = £2Lee D100 .
FA301-2 esrige biig FA301 CENTER BUILDING
FIRST FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
1 |CENTER BUILDING -FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 Al PART-1
SCALE: 3/32" = 1'-0" ¥ ] SHEET NUMBER:
FA-301-1

29 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



KEY NOTES FOR

CENTER BUILDING:

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.

@ DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUCT
WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.

@ U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED
FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.

- Le] ) oH P (5) EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
¥ ¥ @ sec_ w e @, ® EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
D10z 0101 we COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
. TOILETS pREAKRAOY ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS
FA301-1 & ® S e ® % o FA301-1 MAINTAINED. FSC INC.
o secur - — — — | ENGINEERS,LLC |
FA301-) BiE 5105 esrisue 2100 2100 FA301 =) (6) ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS. FUS——
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
MED, RECORDS P . @ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC PHONE: 816.33.4373
2104 NuRSE D105 =Ko NOTIFICATION ON SITE. FAX: 913.722.3484
BEDS STATION
ciie @ @
3 we we GENERAL NOTES:
@ 9105 1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
15[e] ® NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
o . & 5 THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
Ciis Ci09 [ sracE ) SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
o 1o ® 21z ® MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
SToRAGE ‘ cxan = PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
seDS . i : DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
o 108 O ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
C e e —
Ciss sevS e ¥ ® 2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE o 5 10 20
= A s7e SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
o D110 MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
1l ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL ACTIVATE
20 @ Zios P PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. ONE 2]17)3;:1\113185RAT10N
FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD
BE PROVIDED PER FLOOR. DIVISION OF FACILITIES
. MANAGEMENT,
?}qj)g 105 %/J\/ZML LAB 3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND DESIGN AND
e o CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
® MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND CONSTRUCTION
5 seDs SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
% Ciod DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
205 e Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
® Multiple Assets
peps - WESTERN RECEPTION AND
cl1o02
e T DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER
BEDS
o = iz 3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
BEDS
BEDS 100
c121 PROJECT # (C232501
® SITE # 7012
@ ASSET # 9327012063
seDs 2EDS
c122 — MAINTENANCE
G—I—LD BUILDING
ILS 0
| REVISION: 100% BID SET
15De] =0 BUILDING DATE.  05/14/2025
«{[F] [oXl1s REVISION:
DATE:
® CENTER REVISION:
GUILDING PARK DATE:
BEDS . BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
L£123P 127
®
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: JIMA
BUCHANAN qul/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUILDING .~ PROPERTY
1 STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING
CENTER BUILDING
1 CENTER BUILDING -FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 ‘|II|||||||I||II|. EBFL%?&ON FIRST FLOOR
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" \ ]
ALE: 9/328= 170 W FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-301-2

KEY PLAN

30 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



PAINTROOM
STORAGE

AN
Fels

-
15

STORAGE

FAS02-1 20

IT FIBER

B213

BEDS
A2LZ

BEDS
A2LE

BEDS
A2I7

BEDS
AP16

BEDS
A2IS

De]

DAYROOM
A2l4

BEDS
AP13

BEDS
A2l2

BEDS
A2l1

STAIR B1

(]

RES TROOM
B207

ELEC,
A214A

BEDS
A210

®

©

STAIR Al

«[F]
15 o]

CORR.
A221

BEDS
A200

BEDS
DAYROOM A201
Az20

BEDS
A202

BEDS
A203

BEDS
A204

BEDS
A0S

DA YROOM
A209 BEDS
AP06

BEDS
Az07

15[e]

BEDS

®@ 4208

H
[oXla

® s

(oo

DAYROOM
AZz2

BEDS
Az23

BEDS
Ac24

BEDS

Jal==)

BEDS
AL2E

SHOWER N
®

B220

D201

BREAKROOM
B2E2A

STAIR

AR
3084

Bez4

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING *

ceN'
guiLb PARK

BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANA i:_l/ BUILDING
BUILDING L PROPERTY

STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

75
=X

MAINTENANCE STORAGE

® ®

OFFICE
B226

Ay 4
/I\
15
RESTROOM
B227

APPEARS
INFIELD

@

KEY NOTES FOR

CENTER BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.

@ DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUCT
WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.

@ U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED
FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.

@ EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS
MAINTAINED.

(6) ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
CONNECTING SLEEPING SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE
SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL ACTIVATE
PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. ONE
FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD
BE PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

FAS02-1

FAS02-2

7N

JS
/i\

1

SHOWER

D200

&)

OFFICE
re2rs

OFFICE
205

OFFICE
r2N4A

CENTER BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

NORTH

FAS02-2

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

J

.

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)

ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

CENTER BUILDING
SECOND FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-302-1

31 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



NC O NI

be2r

75
75 i
N L]
¥ [F] ® APPEARS
15 DPO1 , INFIELD
15
STORAGE » @ h
TA302-1 2202 ® el TA302-1
BA07 ® @
SHOWER [HP] OFFICE
FAS02-2 5 LN ceos FAS02-7
2 D200
OFFICE OFFICE
ceis ceos
BEDS
ceos ®@
®
® ]
OFFICE
15HZI £207
BEDS BEDS J— DM
coil c207 L
OFFICE
ceos
BEDS
c206
BEDS
OFFICE
ez ce13
® OFFICE
ce09
BEDS
205
BEDS N
OFFICE
P13 ® 15){e] ce10
OFFICE
ce12
BEDS OFFICE
co14 I cai1
@ 204
Z 1 & ceos
[*] ELEC
ce144
BEDS
czoe
@
BEDS
c215
- BEDS
ce1za L20]
BEDS
czo0 BEDS
226
N
BEDS ®
ce18
CoRR BEDS
ceol cees
15[e] DAYROOM
[l cere
BEDS
c224
BEDS
c219
DAYROOM X @ BEDS
c220 ceez
MAINTENANCE
STAIR C1 BUILDING

CENTER BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2

1

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

Gl
T

BUILDING ~

BUCHANAN
BUILDING

KEY NOTES FOR

CENTER BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.

@ DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUC
WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.

@ U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED
FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.

@ EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS
MAINTAINED.

(6) ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
CONNECTING SLEEPING SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE
SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL ACTIVATE
PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. ONE
FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD
BE PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

Q/ BUILDING
| - PROPERTY

STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

CENTER BUILDING
-SECOND FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-302-2

32 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI

KEY NOTES FOR MIKE KEHOE,
CENTER BUILDING: GOVERNOR
MAINTENANGE (1)LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
H i )BUILDING CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
ILS NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.
BUILDING °
(2] STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.
CENTER
LDING PARK (3)DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
seDs e BUILDING UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUCT
e ® ® 52 > WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.
v [4)U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED
sare ® L AUNDRY FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
o BUCHANA g/ BUILDING AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.
G E£DS BUILDING o /A
4 - , PROPERTY (5] EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
BUILDING EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
205 COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
e EDUCATION ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS F SC | N C
MAINTAINED. )
@ BUILDING _ ENGINEERS,LLC |
® (6) ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS. 8675 W 96TH STREET
BEDS OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
4300 ADMIN (7) CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC PHONE: 816.33.4373
5eDS . BUILDING NOTIFICATION ON SITE. FAX: 913.722.3484
T A3~P4
e GENERAL NOTES:
AZ01
1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
205 ne SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
4306 MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
® DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
CONNECTING SLEEPING SPACES. SCALE: 3/32'=1-0" (IN FEET)
e e —
. BEDS ) . .
=] = 2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE ° #
™ SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
@ MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
205 ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL ACTIVATE OFFICE OF
sz FLOW AND TAVPER SWITGH SHOULD ADMINISTRATION
BE PROVIDED PER ELOOR. DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND DESIGN AND
oo ® CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO CONSTRUCTION
4311 MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
2EDS HUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
430 SHU UNCTIONS DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
#eDs seDS Multiple Assets
£310 A306
WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
rsble] CENTER
®
@ STORAGE BEDS 3401 FARAON ST.
4309 4307 ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
®
PROJECT # (C232501
ZIZ Kl
o o SITE # 7012
Ny <, JANI TOR CLASSROOM ,
oS B S ® siner bz sz 00 ASSET# 9327012063
B313 Feis BATHRODM ® ﬁm@ y
STAFF
BATHROOM
J5, N Fe30
a8 - ® 15 REVISION: 100% BID SET
(¢ DATE:  05/14/2025
REVISION:
@ @ L IEUTENANTS DATE:
RESOURCE 30 D‘Z‘ ECE REVISION:
e | ® ® DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
3 ) ¥ CADDWG FILE:  FSC
3 15 DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
e, OF FENDER
FA303-1 I e o ® e BATHROLH FA303-1
SHEET TITLE:
SHOWER
A0 A0 CENTER BUILDING
THIRD FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1
1 CENTER BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 mm SHEET NUMBER:

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" W FA'303'1

33 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



(5 PH g E KEY NOTES FOR
[E CENTER BUILDING:
FA303-1 EE e e e s 74305-1  (1)LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
- — CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
FA303-2 FA303-0 NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

BEDS
£309

BEDS
310

BEDS
311

BEDS
312

BEDS
313

LeX

BEDS
314

BEDS
£315

BEDS
316

BEDS
317

15[Ye]

15)e]
«[F]

BEDS
307

BEDS
L3086

BEDS
305

BEDS
304

BEDS
303

BEDS
302

BEDS
cz01

BEDS
L300

STAIR
£318

oKrs @

©-

BEDS
324

BEDS
323

BEDS
322

BEDS
321

1

CENTER BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

NORTH

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.

@ DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUCT
WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.

@ U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED
FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.

@ EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS
MAINTAINED.

@ ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
CONNECTING SLEEPING SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE
SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL ACTIVATE
PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. ONE
FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD
BE PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING

ILS

BUILDING -

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING
BUILDING L —— PROPERTY

L STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

J

.

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

CENTER BUILDING
THIRD FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-303-2

34 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



FAS04-1

EQ'HO

-
o
o

@
@
; ®M
©
110)e]
®
®
®
®
- 6
@N

110[Ye]

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

CENTER
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANA L~ BuLDING
BUILDING - PROPERTY

L STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

KEY NOTES FOR

CENTER BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.

@ DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUCT
WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.

@ U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED
FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.

@ EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS
MAINTAINED.

(6) ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY
ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
CONNECTING SLEEPING SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE
SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL ACTIVATE
PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. ONE
FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD
BE PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

FAS04-1

FAS04-2

1 CENTER BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

NORTH

FAS04-2

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

CENTER BUILDING
FOURTH FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-304-1

35 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
KEY NOTES FOR MIKE KEHOE,

CENTER BUILDING: GOVERNOR
[#K]ro e 1JLOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE

FAS04-1 N FAS04-1 CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

FAS04-2 FAS04-2
@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE

REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE.

@Z
@

@ DUCT DETECTORS FOR EXTERIOR HVAC
UNITS SHALL BE MOUNTED ON THE DUCT
® WORK INSIDE THE BUILDING.

@ U.L LISTED GUARDS TO BE PROVIDED
FOR ALL DEVICES IN SPORTS/GYM AREA
AND MULTI-PURPOSE ROOM.

@ EXISTING BAS OBSERVED WITH
1) EXISTING CONTROL MODULES.
® COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES TO
® ENSURE EXISTING FUNCTIONALITY IS FSC IN C
MAINTAINED. .
L ENGINEERS, LLC

(6) ROOF/PENTHOUSE ACCESS.

J

8675 W 96TH STREET

OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
(7) CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC PHONE: 816.33.4373

NOTIFICATION ON SITE. FAX: 913.722.3484

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO
NOT HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO
THE HALLS. THE BUILDING IS
® SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY

D] ROOMS AND CORRIDOR
CONNECTING SLEEPING SPACES. SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
e e —
2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE o 5 10 20
SPRINKLER VALVE LOCATIONS AND
MAIN ROUTING TO ENSURE ONLY
ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL ACTIVATE OFFICE OF
PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. ONE
FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD ADMINISTRATION
BE PROVIDED PER FLOOR. DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
3. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND DESIGN AND

CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND CONSTRUCTION

SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

0 3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

® ® PROJECT # (232501
&" SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063
o) 0] {T—LD MAINTENANCE
. BUILDING

N ILS
BUILDING °

o

REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 051472025
REVISION:
DATE:
(ER REVISION:
CEN NG DATE:

1 .CENTER BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 7N BUID PARK SSUB DATE:

SCALE: 3/32" = 1-0" NORTH

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS

LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: JIMA
BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUILDING b PROPERTY

. STORAGE SHEET TITLE:

BUILDING
CENTER BUILDING
EDUCATION FOURTH FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2

2 ELEVATOR PENTHOUSEmm BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:

SCALE: 3/32" =1'-0"
\oRTH FA-304-2

36 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025

ELEVATOR
© MACHINE ROOM
PENTHOUSE




STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,

KEY NOTES FOR GOVERNOR

UNKNOWN AFTER CONTINUATION POWERHOUSE BUILDING:
(] ] (1JLOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE

Oh CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

TOOLS

wXpo (2) FLAMMABLE LIQUID STORAGE PER
N NFPA 30 TREAT SECTION 9.12.2 TREAT
ROOM IN ACCORDANCE WITH CLASS |
DIVISION 2 REQUIREMENTS.

GENERAL NOTES:

STORAGE

LOW

VERHANG EZDEJ\ 1. POWERHOUSE IS NOT SPRINKLER
& & . PROTECTED. A FORM OF HEAT OR
T POWERHOUSE CATWALKS LEEIce SMOKE DETECTION IS TO BE
e PROVIDED THROUGHOUT.

ASBESTOS TUNNEL

NO WORK IN SCOPE [FACU %

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

N
MECHANICAL BOILER ROOM
110 D]

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

(F]

Ko \
BASED ON EXISTING

%N CONDITIONS, PROVIDE
o ASPIRATING SMOKE DETECTION
THROUGHOUT THE
75 POWERHOUSE/BOILER ROOM.
TUNNEL /CHASE ANY EQUIVALENT DETECTION
SYSTEM MAY BE SUBMITTED
N FOR APPROVAL BY THE DOC
@ AND ENGINEER. REFER TO
FA-305-2 FOR PRELIMINARY
LAYOUT.

=K
D]
2

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

o)
HAZARDOUS
STORAGE

) % OFFICE OF

ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

@N

N
110
DE‘/ P13 -0"" K @‘
DM

MECHANICAL

@ @ o)
DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

RESTROOM

\

@ - CONTRACTOR TO PROVIDE
HEAT DETECTION FOR THE
TUNNEL, PROVIDE AN
ESTIMATED (12) HEAT
DETECTORS AS PER

. EXISTING CONDITIONS. HEAT [FTeKho @

DETECTORS IN TUNNEL o)
SHALL BE CONNECTED TO
POWERHOUSE FACU.

STORAGE

,.0-,821

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

o

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

STHE

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

o

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

e
©
o) =IeX

\EK% 5 @ " Ol\é@‘ N

7 apmiy  ACCESS T0 ILS
envp FLogr — LUNNEL S
[
BUILDING

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING

®

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CENTERG
gunLo™ PARK
@ BUILDING

OFFICE

LAUNDRY

BUCHANA g/ BUILDING

BUILDING | PROPERTY
ﬂ STORAGE
BUILDING

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

(]

SHEET TITLE:

POWER HOUSE
BASEMENT, FIRST &
SECOND FLOOR

EDUCATION
BUILDING

2 POWER HOUSE - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" NORTH
U

ADMIN

BUILDING FIRE ALARM PLAN
SHEET NUMBER:
FA-305-1

37 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" NORTH

1 POWER HOUSE - BASEMENT FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN @



o '\ POWERHOUSE UPPER CAT WALKmm

NORTH

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

N
STORE
eomy @ (,5
% N
STORE
N N ROOM
STORE N ®
Ng/
ROOM 15 @
% N
N
N ®
N
WP®\4 NV 15 D@
15 /.:ﬂ N |_\./
InmaTE WP ® i~

SHOWER

©-

LADDER TO ABOVE TOOLS ROODM @
N

75

m@» OPEN 70 BELOW mQ)

UV sapper 10
| | ADDITIONAL
CATWALK

CATWALK

BOILERS

mo _ mO

BOILERS

LADDER T0O
UPPER
CATWALK

OFEN TO BELOW

OPEN 70O

\BEL Ol

MECHANICAL

0}

15
/N

I
N
7504 ED
/N N

0}

MECHANICAL

PRELIMINARY LAYOUT OF
ASPIRATING SMOKE DETECTION
SYSTEM PROVIDED FOR BIDDING
PURPOSES ONLY. COORDINATE
FINAL DETECTION, PIPING, AND
EQUIPMENT LOCATIONS WITH
EXISTING CONDITIONS AND THE
MANUFACTURER. CONTRACTOR
TO PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS REQUIRED TO
MONITOR SYSTEM BY FACU.

3 POWERHOUSE CAT WALK FIRE ALARM mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

1 . POWER HOUSE - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

NORTH

NORTH

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING

ILS

BUILDING -

BUCHANA
BUILDING

KEY NOTES FOR

POWERHOUSE BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ FLAMMABLE LIQUID STORAGE PER
NFPA 30 TREAT SECTION 9.12.2 TREAT
ROOM IN ACCORDANCE WITH CLASS |
DIVISION 2 REQUIREMENTS.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. POWERHOUSE IS NOT SPRINKLER
PROTECTED. A FORM OF HEAT OR
SMOKE DETECTION IS TO BE
PROVIDED THROUGHOUT.

PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

g/ BUILDING
L~ PROPERTY

ﬂ STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION

BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501

SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
SHEET TITLE:
POWER HOUSE
CAT WALK

FIRE ALARM PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-305-2

38 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,

GOVERNOR
KEY NOTES FOR ILS BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY LOCATED IN
BASEMENT LEVEL.

@ 0OS&Y CONTROL VALVE LOCATION.

g @ PLACE HEAT DETECTOR WITHIN 2FT OF
1o SPRINKLERS LOCATED IN THE ROOM
AT LOWER TEMPERATURE FOR SHUNT
TRIP.
GENERAL NOTES:
1. REPLACE FLOW SWITCH AT FIRE
SERVICE ENTRANCE BELOW FLOOR
TO ENSURE ALARM AT WATERFLOW.
TAMPER SWITCHES ARE NOT
CONFERENCE ROOM REQUIRED THROUGHOUT BUILDING FSC I N C -
AS VALVES ARE PROVIDED WITH _ ENGINEERS, LLC
CHAINS AND ARE TO BE INSPECTED 8675 W 96TH STREET
OFTEN. OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
2. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND PHONE: 816.33.4373
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO FAX: 913.722.3484
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
@ ELEVATOR ELEVATOR CONTROL ROOM
REST ROGCM REST ROGCM REST ROGCM
B - H
COPY
OFFICE OFFICE R\)RMWSOGROO\M\ RWOO%M | OFFICE OFFICE OLFLCE OLFIcE N COPY OFFICE
e e = i e,
@ @ @ STORAGE
. . 110N 111
pbH bH
[ N ol F b ] s SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
SN @ = o] SN ~Z e e ——
EXGE ® ® 5 br] ®© % 0 5 10 20
FU \
ACCESS TO FIRE SERVICE
€°(N75 '505‘30 > N ENTRANCE THROUGH FLOOR OFFICE OF
OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE MAIL/VENDING OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE ADMINISTRATION
18 Efg\(/:VHS.VIT/ﬁ%\I{:E(ESIﬁhSM;EEzC:\IIQDED
- ® DIVISION OF FACILITIES
7 EJQI MANAGEMENT,
FOG WP DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,

1 ILS BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN Multiple Assets
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" —
- WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER
3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
TRANSFORMER G—I_LD MAINTENANCE
ROOM BUILDING
-
@ SUILDIGa ! REVISION: 100% BID SET
—~LOCATED ABOVE THE REV?S?&% 05/14/2025
/" ELECTRONIC EQUIPMENT (FIBER DATE:
@  RACK/LOOP CONNECTION) CNTER REVISION:
Bc\'g\\.D‘“G PARK DATE:
EGN BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
\ 75
HEATER ROOM
IR R0, CAD DWG FILE: FSC
~ DRAWN BY: DD/SS
STORAGE CLO. STAIR_HALL LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: IMA
e L - BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUILDING b PROPERTY
1 STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING
ILS BUILDING
EDUCATION BASEMENT & FIRST
BUILDING
FLOOR
5 |ILS BUILDING - BASEMENT FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN 5 FIRE ALARM PLAN
SCALE: NTS — ADMIN
- BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-400

39 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



REST ROOM

COPY
OFFICE OFFICE ‘ FTRMS RO?M‘ ROOM ‘
207 206 205 N
,
‘\15
OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE

o

[eX

NURSE
COMPETENGIES
CENTURION
TRAINING ROOM
%N
o
WOMEN'S 5
® RESTROOM
PH n(F]
@ 15

COPY/BREAK N

N
rooMm  -D{®] conrerence -[{e]

[ 217 |

ILS BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN

Pre{m|

-
o

OFFICE

OFFICE

OFFICE

TRAINING
SUPPLIES

N
LOBBY @ ELEVATOR

%N MEN’S
RESTROOM
-] ®
v B M
(%] (FlbH
[ @ @15N
DH
OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

H14ON

ROOM  FORMS ROOM

KEY NOTES FOR ILS BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY LOCATED IN
BASEMENT LEVEL.

@ 0OS&Y CONTROL VALVE LOCATION.

@ PLACE HEAT DETECTOR WITHIN 2FT OF
SPRINKLERS LOCATED IN THE ROOM
AT LOWER TEMPERATURE FOR SHUNT
TRIP.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. REPLACE FLOW SWITCH AT FIRE
SERVICE ENTRANCE BELOW FLOOR
TO ENSURE ALARM AT WATERFLOW.
TAMPER SWITCHES ARE NOT
REQUIRED THROUGHOUT BUILDING
AS VALVES ARE PROVIDED WITH
CHAINS AND ARE TO BE INSPECTED
OFTEN.

2. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

OFFICE OFFICE

e[ 233 | [ 232 |

o
15<7
[o]
[F]
OFFICE OFFICE

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING ~

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING
BUILDING L —— PROPERTY

L STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

ILS BUILDING
SECOND FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-401

40 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,

GOVERNOR
KEY NOTES FOR ILS BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY LOCATED IN

& BASEMENT LEVEL.
o]
- oFFicE [2) 0S&Y CONTROL VALVE LOCATION.
@ PLACE HEAT DETECTOR WITHIN 2FT OF
SPRINKLERS LOCATED IN THE ROOM
AT LOWER TEMPERATURE FOR SHUNT
OFFICE TRIP.
OFFICE
GENERAL NOTES:
1. REPLACE FLOW SWITCH AT FIRE
OFFICE otE SERVICE ENTRANCE BELOW FLOOR
[ 346 ]
S TO ENSURE ALARM AT WATERFLOW.
TAMPER SWITCHES ARE NOT
REQUIRED THROUGHOUT BUILDING FSC I N C -
AS VALVES ARE PROVIDED WITH . ENGINEERS,LLC
CHAINS AND ARE TO BE INSPECTED 8675 W 96TH STREET
OFTEN. OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
2. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND PHONE: 816.33.4373
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO FAX: 913.722.3484
e N MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND
REST ROOM REST ROOM ‘ nggY ‘(9) ‘ELEV,ATOR‘ REST ROOM REST ROOM SHUNT TRlP FUNCTIONS
COPY
OFFICE OFFICE FORMS ROOM _ ROOM OFFICE OFFICE e >~ 336 N copY OFFICE OFFICE
307 | [ 306 | [ 305 ‘Eme 15NME‘ e %N %TAEN’S N DE 15T>EH Ré)}@}M ‘F(‘)RMESSZROO‘M [ 35t ] [ 330 ]
® RESTROOM N RESTROOM ® s0){e]
[ - ] [ [ - ]
@ @ od b o @ @
[+] loH n(ElLs] [+] n[FJoH o -
15 15 ® | @ 15 15 @ ® 15 75 a
B [¢] or or (&) Fl
SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
T e —
N 0 5 10 20
150{e]
OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE QFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE CANTEEN QFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE OFFICE
316 S17E
OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
DESIGN AND
_ CONSTRUCTION
1 ILS BUILDING - THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN / S
SCALE: 3/32" = 1-0" T DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets
WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER
3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS )
i REVISION: 100% BID SET
BUILDING DATE: _ 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
o ER REVISION:
N CENT .
g gULDNC PARK DATE:
STORAGE STORAGE BUILDING ISSUE DATE
) ) CAD DWG FILE: FSC
1e] [eKfo DRAWN BY: DD/SS
- - - - LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: IMA
@ @ BUCHANAN qul/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
N N
o 0 BUILDING b PROPERTY
. STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING
ILS BUILDING
EDUCATION THIRD FLOOR & ATTIC
FIRE ALARM PLAN
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
- FA-402
2 ILS BUILDING - ATTIC FIRE ALARM PLAN O
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" =

41 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



Foc %N KEY NOTES FOR STATE OF MISSOURI

MIKE KEHOE
& e eure MAINTENANCE BUILDING: GOVERNOR ’
STORAGE
\ \ (1) LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
TR | eroesn CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
VAULT
LOCf;HOP :115(,\‘ RE%@SED EEIM NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.
o ] (2) FLAMMABLE LIQUID STORAGE PER
- o NFPA 30 TREAT SECTION 9.12.2 TREAT
a0 ROOM IN ACCORDANCE WITH CLASS |
* ez DIVISION 2 REQUIREMENTS FOR
ELEVATOR To0L § ELECTRICAL INSTALLATION AS
OUTLINED BY NFPA 72.
WOR&/\%%DSHOP ET SHOP
Nl (125 | 75?5@@&'30 N 131 ]
0,04 (oK @ ) 3 MEZZANINE FIRE ALARM PLAN
© T %) GENERAL NOTES:

1. BASEMENT PLANS ARE
DIAGRAMMATIC ONLY - FIELD VERIFY
%N AC SHOP FINAL DIMENSIONS AND ENSURE
& DETECTION IS PROVIDED PER NFPA

ol B o 72 FSC INC.

_ 2. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND (__ENGINEERS, LLC  J
gy N CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
75 8675 W 96TH STREET
= 2 @ MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND OVERLAND PARK. KS. 66212
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS. PHONE: 816.33.4373

Ciss ] FAX: 913.722.3484
N EAST BASEMENT FIRE ALARM PLAN 7iN
[ 106 ] Y <T> 4 U

OFFICE AREA WELDING SHOP ELEV. ( SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" NORTH

1464
® 300
N

TOILET [eXs0

N
F 1071
PME I CLERK TYPIST ® FM
N NN OFFICE 0
FACU

AR COMPRESSOR EXISTING ON ROOF FLOW 3FAF500 Wh 75
ROOM SWITCH SHALL BE REPLACED o %
@ ' 7 ol

N9
P4

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

Ple] o=

4-FAF500 TOILET

_
g = Oy
s

o
z

\

/
15 15 @
N N
&) x
PAINT ROOM

@[ 12 LOCKER ROOM
N 5\ SOUTHWEST BASEMENT FIRE ALARM PLA

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND

STORAGE CONSTRUCTION

112C ] [ 1128 ] [112a ]
1 . MAINTENANCE BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM pLan/ EPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" NORTH @

gl
N

5-FAF500

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
o) Multiple Assets

CLEANING mao
TOOLS ® © STORAGE #3
CHEVICALS 214 i WESTERN RECEPTION AND

TOILET 714

DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL

15
<zN ELECTRONICS AND
CENTER

'
. » 3401 FARAON ST.
2 2 ol o NORTH BASEMENT BELOW Lock sHop /I, ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
| O fsoaews W
FREIGHT ELEV. PROJECT # C232501

Fas SITE # 7012

N TOOL ROOM

(ORI ASSET# 9327012063

%N MAINTENANCE
15 BUILDING

% ILS REVISION: 100% BID SET

: BUILDING * DATE: 05/14/2025

FIRE & SAFETY REVISION:
cms;r;ow DATE:
ER REVISION:

CENT ;
oG L ARK DATE:

X :
BREAZKO5AREA EWNE’ 75N|>E| oK BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
N N R
75 o] [®Kpo CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS

@ T00L < LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: IMA
Wb ROOM o X BUCHANAN =" BuiDNG DESIGNED BY: FSC
UILDING . ——— ' PROPERTY

e I STORAGE SHEET TITLE:

STOREKEEPER OFFICE BUILDING
MAINTENANCE BUILDING

e
EDUCATION FIRE ALARM PLAN

o

N 19,

®

ELEV.

STORAGE ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:

FA-500

2 MAINTENANCE BUILDING -SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLANmm KEY PLAN

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" W 42 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025




o
@
@
N
K
TUNNEL 2
®
®
134E
K
@ ©
®
ot
1
OFFICE &
®
% i
A
®
@
«[F]
WG
]
5 «LE]
O]
OF e
¢ O
1504
&)
% [o)qr10
K
® ®

- o]

|
N15

LAB

EXAM_ROOM 1

(1250 ]
®
MECH. ROOM
% s
O3 v
& 3
MECH. ROOM
® .,
@ 5N 115
% EXAM_ROOM 2
CHRONIC
N CARE
EMERGENCY ®
ROOM
@ DIRECTOR OF
NURSES
@
15N STORAGE
‘&
Vi MEDICAL
RECORDS
DENTAL .
[Ci1ep ] IES
15N 115
w CONFERENCE
ROOM
O
BIOHAZARD
WASTE %-
(114D ] "5

* UTILITY CRAWL ﬁ

SPACE

wpP
DS

®.

®

,— LOCATION SHALL BE
/" COORDINATED ON

/ SITE / SPRINKLER
RISER.

@
&6 ©

@

O}

‘ UTILITY CRAWL ‘

SPACE

BASEMENT FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN mm

SCALE: 1/16" = 1'-0"

1 PARK BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN mm

SCALE: 1/16" = 1'-0"

NORTH

.
TUNNEL 1
BUILDING CUT OFF CONTINUES ON
INACCESSIBLE TUNNELS
FAGO1-1
FA601-2
FDC wp
K@
N
EDUCATION
®
115
4"
S
15
@
15
-HEC %
15,
Nt
114C
115C

EDUCATION
/ WING

J5
\gé

CLASS ROOM

15

e

®

e ®

<«

NORTH

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE

CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY

ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC

NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1.

RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING
SPACES.

FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.

. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS

NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72.

PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING

ILS
BUILDING -

CENT ER

BU“‘

BUCHANAN
BUILDING

DING

PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

g/ BUILDING
- PROPERTY

J STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION

BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE:
REVISION:

DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: ESC
SHEET TITLE:
PARK BUILDING -
BASEMENT & FIRST

FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-600

43 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



[oK]s
N
@
@' @
\EKT% <%5
TUNNEL 2 TUNNEL 1
BUILDING CUT OFF CONTINUES ON
INACCESSIBLE TUNNELS
®
®
134E K
®@ & ®
[ 130E ]
FAGOO-1 ® - FAGOT-1
FAGOO-2 FAGOT-2

15 @4

PARK BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" NORTH

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING
SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.

4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72.

5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN L= BULDING
BUILDING . —— PROPERTY

J STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

KEY PLAN

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

PARK BUILDING
FIRST FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1

SHEET NUMBER:

FA600-1

44 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



DENTAL
ROOM

118D

.

®

15|N

Y

<

BIOHAZARD
WASTE !

114D 15

EMERGENCY
ROOM

CONFERENCE
ROOM

| 94t K
® &
FAGO0-1 @ FABOT-1
FAGO0-2 FABOT-2
15,%(—«
OFFICE
®
s, %, 111E
/i\ /i\
®
@2
«[F]
o]
30 FDC wp
) KI ‘ZK]ZJS@
g e
@“ (F]
1584
®
% [eXK]110
K
® ®
EDUCATION
[ 1270 ]
®
[ 126D ]
@ '!1_5
[ 1250 | \
N
® v
Xo- [ 164D ]
MECH. ROOM N0
15%“?> {% - [122¢ ] 15@
115 LAB
% 2 N ®
® 121C @
MM ® EXAM_ROOM 1 e
@l -:1{: 118C @
1 15 N
@ %% EXAM ROOM 2
117C
CHRONIC
N CARE B,
@ 116C %
® DIRECTOR OF
NURSES
STORAGE 115C
110D
MEDICAL
RECORDS
111D
1 PARK BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 ,.1II||I||||I||II|.;
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" W

2

[

@N

@N

wP
7sP{e]

UTILITY CRAWL ?

SPACE

¢

—LOCATION SHALL BE

SITE / SPRINKLER

// COORDINATED ON

@N
@N
@
®
O RISER.
oo @

UTILITY CRAWL ¢
SPACE

BASEMENT FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN mmm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

EDUCATION
/ WING
5
\<o§
| O\
CLASS ROOM b, o
112C N
N_ g~
151
L 111

®

ILS
BUILDING -

NORTH

N

L

BUCHANAN
BUILDING

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING
SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.

4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72.

5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

MAINTENANCE

BUILDING

cENT
gulLP

eR
\NG

PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

g/ BUILDING
- PROPERTY

J STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION

BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE.:
REVISION:

DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
SHEET TITLE:
PARK BUILDING
FIRST FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
SHEET NUMBER:
FAB00-2

45 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



“&
®
*15 1552
®
S ©
® <é&5
)
&
NS
& © ©
< 15
A
»
N
o
N
%
FAGO1-1
FAGO1-2
[2240 ]
(223D |
&,
®
& @
15%%
CONTRACTOR TO COMPLY
WITH NFPA 72 DETECTION
COVERAGE FOR BEAMS R @
AND JOIST CEILING AREA ©WG CELL
\ HOUSING
BEAM CEILING AREA
N
@WG
R ovM
@, -]
@10
&

®
®
®
30
30 i
—_— e N Eir__ e —
®
15 15/
* 5 S
®
K N
B ® S,
DM ‘
& Die]
OFFICE
15,84
®
30
®
LIBRARY
AREA
®
1§+;
®
Al 15
Z\?_
N
INDOOR
REC

-]

OFFICE

CORO)

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
" CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
® CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

® @ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

® GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT

HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE

DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS

o AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING

® A SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.
___________ 3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.

4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72.

5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
0 NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

DAY ROOM

® MAINTENANCE
$ BUILDING

ILS
BUILDING -

A

Q@F PARK
" BUILDING
///\,“‘:_

CENTER ¢
GUILDING <

#* LAUNDRY

‘© BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING
BUILDING .~ PROPERTY

h STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

1 PARK BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN mm

SCALE: 1/16" = 1'-0"

NORTH

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501

SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
SHEET TITLE:

PARK BUILDING
SECOND FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-601

46 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



®

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK

CONNECTIVITY.
2] ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.
<§> (3] CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.
®
y GENERAL NOTES:
® R
1 1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
£ MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF FSC I N C
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE | ENGINEERS, LLC )
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS So75 W SoTH STREET
® AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING OVERLAND PARK KS. 66212
SPACES. PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484
2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
® ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
& ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
® & Q ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
@ & > ® PROVIDED PER FLOOR.
@ N 15 @‘
3 o 3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
N SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
S SWITCHES.
] VRS
O
& 4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS N
SOl S NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF i L2
& & RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS 0 T 20
S & S5° ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
® “® S ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
> » e SERVE PER NFPA 72.
i;&\&’ o e Sac %@ OFFICE OF
o 5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS ADMINISTRATION
%\@ NG NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL DIVISION OF FACILITIES
< S S5 AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS. MANAGEMENT,
Q N
& ® S DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION
© DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
® ® Multiple Assets
WESTERN RECEPTION AND
FABOT -1 " 5 FAB01 -1 DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
ﬁ_f CENTER
FABOT-2 ® FAGOT-2
3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012
1 PARK BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 mm ASSET # 9327012063
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" W
MAINTENANCE REVISION: 100% BID SET
BUILDING DATE:  05/14/2025
ILS REVISION
BUILDING ° DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
LAUNDRY
BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING b PROPERTY PARK BUILDING-
= STORAGE
BUILDING SECOND FLOOR
EDUCATION FIRE ALARM PLAN
BUILDING PART-1
SHEET NUMBER:
ADMIN - -
BUILDING FA 601 1

47 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

FABD1 -1 ) (%] FAB01-1
)
FABO1-2 @ AB01-2 GENERAL NOTES:
1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF FSC I N C
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE ( ENGINEERS,LLC |
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS 675 W 90TH] STREET
v & AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING OVERLAND PARK KS. 66212
-+ -+ SPACES. PHONE: 816.33.4373
@ FAX: 913.722.3484
2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
@ oFFICE ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
T o PROVIDED PER FLOOR.
= N 3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
(€] @ [z ] [ ® SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
5 SWITCHES.
F
@ D 4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS o
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF bl L2
[ 202 ] - RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS 0 5 10 20
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72. OFFICE OF
5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS ADMINISTRATION
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL DIVISION OF FACILITIES
15,04 AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS. MANAGEMENT,
217E
@ DESIGN AND
30 @ — CONSTRUCTION
DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
@ 210E @
LIBRARY .
i DAY ROOM Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
-] Multiple Assets
® WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
® B CENTER
. 2 )
%}é’ 3401 FARAON ST.
® < ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
- o Jros PROJECT # (232501
@ & o 5 SITE # 7012
&S N
G & e Gy ASSET# 9327012063
© ® @ e - %?
VS A\
@l . INDOOR &
15 REC. ® @
: % -] .o MAINTENANCE
0] / S BUILDING REVISION: 100% BID SET
CONTRACTOR TO COMPLY ) > P BUILDIIl!l_(s; 1 REV?S?gEI: 03/14/2023
S .
WITH NFPA 72 DETECTION i\g@ DATE:
COVERAGE FOR BEAMS & @ REVISION:
AND JOIST CEILING AREA wG CELL DATE:
\ HOUSING NTER i
BEAM CEILING AREA ®@ cE \NG ISSUE DATE:
gul\P PARK
BUILDING
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
@&5 DRAWN BY: DD/SS
) CHECKED BY: IMA
- we LAUNDRY DESIGNED BY FSC
@RWG ] ® BUCHANAN i]/ BUILDING
BUILDING L propeRTY SHEET TITLE:
* STORAGE PARK BUILDING
& -SECOND FLOOR
O N EDUCATION FIRE ALARM PLAN
®
- L, © PART-2
151
& ADMIN SHEET NUMBER:
BUILDING FA'601 _2
1 PARK BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 ,.||||||||||||||.,k
SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"
KEY PLAN 48 OF 61 SHEETS

05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
& GOVERNOR

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

(1JLOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
o . CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
& ® CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

Q& ® @ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
o) ® ® S @ NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

® GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
s & HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
%, BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
RS 5@ %QQ
. . MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF FSC INC.
e 7 ¥ # PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE _ ENGINEERS,LLC )
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS SO
AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING OVERLAND PARK KS. 66212

QQ/L) 8
& ® b SPACES. PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

4
@0
&

N7

%

® 2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
@ ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

________________ L T T T e 3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
sl SWITCHES.

4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS o
o] NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF )
% RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS o 5 10 20
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
@ SERVE PER NFPA 72.

OFFICE OF
5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS ADMINISTRATION
- NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL DIVISION OF FACILITIES
& AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS. MANAGEMENT,
54 DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

5384 .
© Replace Fire Alarm Panels,

® . Multiple Assets

sD{e]

® ® WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

© 3401 FARAON ST.
s © A ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
® SITE # 7012

N
&° < ®

@® &, N ¢ ASSET# 9327012063

Cx
%%
%

BUILDING DATE:  05/1472025
‘ ILS REVISION:
S ® BUILDING ° DATE:
) REVISION:
DATE:

® &
ER ; ISSUE DATE:
&, ® ceNT LY 4

\NG Y
%" 7 BuiLpiNG CAD DWG FILE: FSC

® Y o X DRAWN BY: DD/SS
& V AN CHECKED BY: IMA
{ : DESIGNED BY: FSC

o LAUNDRY

& BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING | I/
PROPERTY PARK BUILDING

hy STORAGE

BUILDING THIRD FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN

& & @ {T—LD MAINTENANGE REVISION: 100% BID SET

EDUCATION
BUILDING

SHEET NUMBER:

ADMIN FA-602
1 \PARK BUILDING -THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN (alimy BUILDING

SCALE: 1/16" = 1'-0" NORTH

49 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



15-‘):

&

FAB0Z-1

) ®
®
&
15
Q@\;\& 1 i
RS ®
5
8
B
®

®
& @
®
kS

)
A/Oo %

FAB0Z-1

FA602-2

[eX]s

1 PARK BUILDING -THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

NORTH

Gl
N

FAB02-2

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE

CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY

ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC

NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

© GENERAL NOTES:

® 1.

15

RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING
SPACES.

FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.

. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS

NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72.

PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING

ILS
BUILDING -

ceNT
guno

BUCHANAN
BUILDING

ER
NG PARK

BUILDING

LAUNDRY

Ej/ BUILDING
- PROPERTY

hy STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION

BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

PARK BUILDING
THIRD FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-602-1

50 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK

CONNECTIVITY.
(2) ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.
(3] CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE. PROFESSIONAL SEAL
30
FABD2 -1 ) [¢] FABD2-1
[ GENERAL NOTES:
FAB0Z2-2 ® FAB02-2 — —
- 1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
3 HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
o BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO FSC |NC
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF -
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE | ENGINEERS,LLC |
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS 675 W 90TH] STREET
153@1 E‘i} _ AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING OVERLAND PARK KS. 66212
¥ ¥ [ 3236 | SPACES. PHONE: 816.33.4373
= - FAX: 913.722.3484
@ 2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
@ ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.
3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
[308E ] SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
& SWITCHES.
K
NLE] 4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
DM 4, . . a4
@ ‘ NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF bl L2
At RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS 0 5 10 20
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72.
OFFICE OF
5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS ADMINISTRATION
5 @ NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL DIVISION OF FACILITIES
N _ AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS. MANAGEMENT,
g L & DESIGN AND
] CONSTRUCTION
30 @ @
% DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
® ® }
Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets
WESTERN RECEPTION AND
® DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER
@ |15
Ca \ 3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
®
. PROJECT # (232501
2 o & SITE# 7012
AN
Q0 &, & o & ASSET# 9327012063
15 N\ ;
@/\%g \Z‘Q N 15 @N
| @ ® G S é& ®®©
@"S‘ \ - K\0° \ MAINTENANCE
15{‘} 2\%@% S @ BUILDING REVISION: 100% BID SET
& BUILDING - REV%%EI: 0r1412025
NS .
5 e DATE:
o S REVISION:
N .
S » nTER DATE:
S S BU“_D\NG PARK ISSUE DATE:
S N ® BUILDING
P |
é - CAD DWG FILE:; FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
@gs CHECKED BY: IMA
LAUNDRY DESIGNED BY: FSC
BUCHANAN g/ BUILDING
® BUILDING L/ pROPERTY SHEET TITLE:
= STORAGE
BUILDING PARK BUILDING
THIRD FLOOR
EDUCATION
BUILDING FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
& @
<(K<> ADMIN SHEET NUMBER:
BUILDING
FA-602-2

1 PARK BUILDING -THIRD FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

51 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025




15_&

®
® %5
OO
R
f\g§ ® ;
15
5 ®
Q\Q
A % o
K 2
8 ®
ous®
t\b@
RS
S
& ®
®
O]
®
&
FABO3-1 (o]
_____________.___s%__.__‘____.__ﬂ___
|
FA603-2 —
®
: *1,5'
N
® S
CLASSROOM
R 413E
@ [413e ]
DM
R
CLASSROOM
409E
"
30 84
.
© ®
30 @ @
30
® @
MOP_ROOM
L -
®
®
B>
®
CELL
HOUSING
(230 ]
CELL
%@\ HOUSING
@%5
@ CELL
. ® HOUSING
o
15
%} CELL
2 HOUSING
CELL
HOUSING
®
CELL
HOUSING

<&
[

%
()

A
005((
%

CELL
HOUSING

1 PARK BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN mm

NORTH

SCALE: 1/16" = 1'-0"

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING
SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.

4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72.

5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

CENTER N\ _ 74
guno™ . PaRK

BUILDING

LAUNDRY

Q/ BUILDING
| - PROPERTY

L STORAGE
BUILDING

BUCHANAN
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

KEY PLAN

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501

SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
SHEET TITLE:

PARK BUILDING
FOURTH FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-603

52 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

R 1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
® MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
® PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
® DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
s AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING
SPACES. FSC | N C
ENGINEERS, LLC |
4@ 2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER -
KOs VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO 8675 W 96TH STREET
s " ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL OVEgﬁg':lﬂE)_F;ﬁggvsﬁz726212
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. E A 013799 3484
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.
® 3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
® SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
; ® SWITCHES.
®© ® & D
4 o8 4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
@ ® 3 NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
é&s RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
%> ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
S ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
ig&\ SERVE PER NFPA 72. SCALE: 3/32"=1-0" (IN FEET)
e e —
S ® » 5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS ° %
D 15@ S NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
o G © & NN AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
5 Tro 5 OFFICE OF
) . ) ADMINISTRATION
&> 115 “a- S
f§§ ® d v i@@ DIVISION OF FACILITIES
S o MANAGEMENT,
] N
XS DESIGN AND
& s CONSTRUCTION
3 ® )
DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
®
Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets
®
® WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
4018 401C 30
46031 2 4603-1 CENTER
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
416E
PROJECT # (C232501
SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
PARK BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 ,.1II|||||||I||II|.k ILS || REVISION: 100% BID SET
1 BUILDING
SCALE: 3/32"=1-0" DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
gNTER .
Bc\'g\\.D‘“G PARK DATE:
BUILDING ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
LAUNDRY CHECKED BY: JIMA
BUCHANAN -~ BUIDNG DESIGNED BY: FSC
- PROPERTY
1 STORAGE SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING
PARK BUILDING
EBPL%?&ON FOURTH FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1
ADMIN
BUILDING SHEET NUMBER:
FA-603-1

53 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI
KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING: MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:
1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT

FAGD3—1 = % CAB03-1 HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
. - BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
[ MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
Ao ® AL PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
e w AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING

SPACES. FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER - J
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO 8675 W 96TH STREET
15 15 ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL OVE?ﬁé’:,E.F;‘}Eﬁgﬁ%?T”z
” ¥ 415E ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. EAX. 913792 3484
. ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
416F ® e PROVIDED PER FLOOR.
S 3 CLASSROON 3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.
4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
) RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
® L] ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
‘o ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
410E DM3°‘ SERVE PER NFPA 72. SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
™ ey —
© CLASSROOM 0 5 10 20’
5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
. OFFICE OF
o ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
| DESIGN AND
® ® ® CONSTRUCTION
30 @ —
% DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
© = o ® Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets
o oo WESTERN RECEPTION AND
I DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
© CENTER
® 15
g & y 3401 FARAON ST.
\ ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
® v
PROJECT # (232501
-406C
O SITE # 7012
T = ASSET # 9327012063
Q@ 03 [ 400 ] @
= K i s O
& ® HOUSING . 3 ®®@ MAINTENANCE
@ [ 406D | BUILDING
15%> ® ILS REVISION: 100% BID SET
4 HOUSING BUILDING ° REV%%EI: 05/14/2025
:
2 DATE:
S REVISION:
® cENT%:; % DATE:
- guno! PARK ISSUE DATE:
] e ® " BulDiG
// CAD DWG FILE; FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
® 15 _ LAUNDRY CHECKED BY:. JIMA
ég BUCHANAN g/ BUILDING DESIGNED BY: FSC
411D BUILDING D\
< PROPERTY SHEET TITLE:
75 ® : STORAGE
BUILDING PARK BUILDING
BUILDING FIRE ALARM PLAN
O PART-2
. 1 PARK BUILDING - FOURTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2 mm Ao —
® 5 SCALE: 3/32" = 10" s ADMIN SHEET NUMBER:
W I ) BUILDING
& FA-603-2

54 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING: MIKE KEHOE,
& % GOVERNOR
9 1)LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
® CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.
-
© (2] ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
N ABANDONED.
kS
3] CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
® NOTIFICATION ON SITE.
® 8 GENERAL NOTES:
& O
& 4 1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
o HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
% BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
® DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
& AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING
| SPACES. FSC INC.
ks ENGINEERS, LLC
2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER \- J
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO 8675 W 96TH STREET
& ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL OVEgﬁg':lﬂE)_F;ﬁggvsﬁz726212
® ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE. CAX. 513750 A
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.
3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
® SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.
FABO4—1 g & FABOA—1
————— oz s L = 4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
FAG04-2 ® FAG04-2 NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
] SERVE PER NFPA 72. SCALE: 3/32"=1-0" (IN FEET)
™ ey —
¥ X 0 5 10 20
5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
[ . NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
® %TJ 2 AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.
® | OFFICE OF
. 8 s ADMINISTRATION
® DIVISION OF FACILITIES
¢ ® ® MANAGEMENT,
ool X DESIGN AND
© e ]
CONSTRUCTION
DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
. 2 PARK BUILDING - PENTHOUSE FIRE ALARM PLAN mm
=X ® ¢ SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" W
& & Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
® e Multiple Assets
® WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER
o 3401 FARAON ST.
5 ST JOSEPH, MO 64506
e PROJECT # (C232501
& | SITE # 7012
R ASSET# 9327012063
® é& %
) P ® %
& &
S MAINTENANCE REVISION: 100% BID SET
Ny BUILDING DATE:  05/14/2025
& LS REVISION:
® BUILDING * REVII)S?OTII::I:-
& DATE:
2 ISSUE DATE:
guno v 4 PARK
" BuDIG CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
% CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC
)
s ] LAUNDRY
“<© BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING SHEET TITLE:
BUILDING
| L——  PROPERTY
® ] PROPERT PARK BUILDING
BUILDING FIFTH FLOOR
EDUCATION FIRE ALARM PLAN
BUILDING
SHEET NUMBER:
ADMIN FA-604
PARK BUILDING - FIFTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN BUILDING

SCALE: 1/16" = 1'-0" NORTH

55 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



\

S

© @
& @ @
&
%
®

®

N ¥ S01A 30
FAG04—1 15 (o] FAGD4—1
FAG04—2 @ FABDA—2

1

®@ -

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

PARK BUILDING - FIFTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-1 @

NORTH

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING
SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.

4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72.

5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

cENTi‘RG Y 4
guno ? & PARK
| BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN L= BuLDING
BUILDING  —— PROPERTY

hy STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET
DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:
DATE:
REVISION:
DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

PARK BUILDING
FIFTH FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-1

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-604-1

56 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



FAGO4-1

FABO4-1

FA604-2

516E

[ 526 | [ 524E |

15

\1 5/ A
/i\ /1\

5226 | [ 520E |

S17E

N/
oo
b4

SR
2N
Q)Qg

> &
A
ES

b

1

FABD4-2

2 PARK BUILDING - PENTHOUSE FIRE ALARM PLAN mm

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

RS
S
DG

)
&

513C

®

PARK BUILDING - FIFTH FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN PART-2

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

Gl
N

NORTH

KEY NOTES FOR PARK BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR NETWORK
CONNECTIVITY.

@ ELEVATOR SHAFT IS PERMANENTLY
ABANDONED.

@ CONTRACTOR TO VERIFY FINAL FDC
NOTIFICATION ON SITE.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. RESIDENTIAL SLEEPING ROOMS DO NOT
HAVE SOLID PARTITIONS TO THE HALLS. THE
BUILDING IS SPRINKLER PROTECTED. TO
MAINTAIN THE EXISTING LEVEL OF
PROTECTION, PROVIDE FULL SMOKE
DETECTION THROUGHOUT THE DAY ROOMS
AND CORRIDOR CONNECTING SLEEPING
SPACES.

2. FIELD VERIFY THE FINAL FIRE SPRINKLER
VALVE LOCATIONS AND MAIN ROUTING TO
ENSURE ONLY ONE FLOW SWITCH WILL
ACTIVATE PER FLOOR / SPRINKLER ZONE.
ONE FLOW AND TAMPER SWITCH SHOULD BE
PROVIDED PER FLOOR.

3. ALL DUCT DETECTORS IN PARK BUILDING
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH REMOTE TEST
SWITCHES.

4. RELOCATE SMOKE DETECTORS AS
NECESSARY TO ENSURE FULL COVERAGE OF
RESIDENTIAL HALLS AND THAT DOOR HOLDS
ARE PROVIDED A SMOKE DETECTOR FOR
ACTIVATION WITHIN 5FT OF THE DOOR THEY
SERVE PER NFPA 72.

5. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
NECESSARY TO MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL
AND SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS.

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

. J

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

Ej/ BUILDING
- PROPERTY

hy STORAGE
BUILDING

BUCHANAN
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

SITE # 7012
ASSET # 9327012063
REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE.:
REVISION:

DATE:
ISSUE DATE:
CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: IMA
DESIGNED BY: ESC
SHEET TITLE:
PARK BUILDING
FIFTH FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN
PART-2
SHEET NUMBER:
FA-604-2

57 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



N
15,04
BATHROOM
J5N
— /i\
75
® N
FORMS @
RoOM OFFICE OFFICE
#Ko
K

N

DRYERS

N
X0

FREIGHT
ELEVATOR

0}

MECH.
ROOM

DRYERS

N

1 LAUNDRY BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

Ng/
15 &

WAITING ROOM

2 LAUNDRY BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN

N
=X

CAGES

N
[eXl7s

FREIGHT
ELEVATOR

@

STORAGE

STORAGE

STORAGE
STORAGE

NORTH

STORAGE

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

/lmy
N

75N

wp
FDCEI m
FACU

N N

L BATHROOM
°O /

@

N

\1 5
/i\

WASHERS

/BATH ROOM

N\~

15
/i\

afe]

®

ELECTRICAL
ROOM &
STORAGE

KEY NOTES FOR
LAUNDRY BUILDING:

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL
BE CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ STROBE NOTIFICATION DEVICE
REPLACED WITH HORN/STROBE DUE
TO AMBIENT SOUND LEVEL

MAINTENANCE
BUILDING
ILS
BUILDING -

CENTERG
gunoW PARK
BUILDING

LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN ~ L——" BuLDING
BUILDING L —— PROPERTY

STORAGE
BUILDING

EDUCATION
BUILDING

ADMIN
BUILDING

STATE OF MISSOURI
MIKE KEHOE,
GOVERNOR

FSC INC.

ENGINEERS, LLC

J

.

8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,

DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
CENTER

3401 FARAON ST.
ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

PROJECT # (232501
SITE # 7012

ASSET # 9327012063

REVISION: 100% BID SET

DATE: 05/14/2025
REVISION:

DATE:
REVISION:

DATE:

ISSUE DATE:

CAD DWG FILE: FSC
DRAWN BY: DD/SS
CHECKED BY: JIMA
DESIGNED BY: FSC

SHEET TITLE:

LAUNDRY BUILDING
FIRST FLOOR
FIRE ALARM PLAN

SHEET NUMBER:

FA-700

58 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI

KEY NOTES FOR MIKE KEHOE,
EDUCATION BUILDING: GOVERNOR
@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE

CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

@ REPLACE EXISTING FACU WITH NEW
FACU TO BE SLAVE PANEL TO MAIN
PANEL LOCATED IN E120. PROVIDE
EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
ZONE 1: EDUCATION ZONE 3: WAREHOUSE REQUIRED TO COMBINE BUILDING INTO
/ / SINGLE FIRE ALARM SYSTEM THAT WILL
, , , EVACUATE THE ENTIRE BUILDING UPON
2 ALARM. ALTERNATIVELY CONTRACTOR
MAY OPT TO PROVIDE AN

ANNUNCIATOR PANEL IN LIEU OF A
A CONTROL PANEL IN THIS LOCATION.

GENERAL NOTES:
1. PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND FSC INC.

CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO
, ENGINEERS, LLC
NOTE: ZONES ARE PROVIDED TO AID IN MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND \-

ADDRESSING SYSTEM DEVICES ONLY.
< A T e o o SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS. 8675 W 96TH STREET
- FIRE ALARM OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
\ ZONE 1: EDUCATION PHONE: 816.33.4373

FAX: 913.722.3484
EDUCATION BUILDING - FIRST ZONING PLAN /é?

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" \

J

NORTH

TO LOWER LEVEL

CAGES CAGES

STORAGE S%E SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)

e —
STORAGE 0 5 10' 20'

rsDe]

110NDE\ \EQN”’
OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATION

WOMENS  MENS DIVISION OF FACILITIES

RESTROOM RESTROOM

; /S — MANAGEMENT,
ol A X DESIGN AND
2% /
lx./ %]
®

-
o
o

O
=

& CONSTRUCTION

w A2 DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
£102 @
75

wKs Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

E104

STORAGE
E134
REST SHARED SHARED SHARED INMATE E132 @

g ROOM STORAGE TEACH TEACH TEACH SHARED INSTRUCTOR TOILET

E111 E110 E108 E1068 15 84 T%‘EE AW s CORRIDOR WESTERN RECEPTION AND

. - (e DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL
: \/ % CENTER

15
+ STAIRS

z. @

[eX
Fela
z

75 VY% CORRIDOR

FDC ® STORAGE s 3401 FARAON ST.

@ 15 R
ﬁ STORAGE

s ° ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

MECHANICAL N /15\N

CORRIDOR E116
K BREAK

COMPUTER LAB ROOM
LOBBY ® Ei17 E18B ® ® ® ® N PROJECT # (232501

LIBRARY K
S SITE # 7012
o 5 "o ASSET # 9327012063

(D)
o4 [0
| [ @

=
3

|
o
5
N
LM
@

& 15 18]

R CEQ 15 @
25004 ® CORRIDOR DM

clgv: ® ©)] ™

©s
aL}E\
©®

/
ey 4

FACU[F] o Losby MAINTENANCE
“Quir © @ N (@N LIBRARIAN = BUILDING REVISION: 100% BID SET

EQUIP N COMPUTER COMPUTER
19 ® ey oy COUNSELOR COUNSELOR OFFICE ILS DATE: 05/14/2025

SEUDPUECRAVT‘\SOONR e E124 E125 VEESST @ %N @ ® N<?> BUILDING REVISION:

E120 E121 STORAGE ® 15 DATE:
([ e © REVISION:

e DATE:

WP R:
N GENTE .
oG b ARK ISSUE DATE:

BUILDING

CAD DWG FILE: FSC

DRAWN BY: DD/SS

CHECKED BY: JIMA
LAUNDRY DESIGNED BY: FSC

BUCHANAN i]/ BUILDING
BUILDING 1 PROPERTY SHEET TITLE:

S Zal® SULONG EDUCATION BUILDING
FIRST FLOOR
SUILDING FIRE ALARM PLAN

1 EDUCATION BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN /é?

NORTH

ADMIN SHEET NUMBER:

BUILDING FA'8OO

59 OF 61 SHEETS
05/13/2025



STATE OF MISSOURI

KEY NOTES FOR MIKE KEHOE,
EDUCATION BUILDING: GOVERNOR
@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE

ZONE 2: CANTEEN .
/ ya FONE 35 WAREHOUSE CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
/ = NETWORK CONNECTIVITY.

/

|

i @ REPLACE EXISTING FACU WITH NEW

‘. FACU TO BE SLAVE PANEL TO MAIN

B A Ay PANEL LOCATED IN E120. PROVIDE
EQUIPMENT AND CONNECTIONS
REQUIRED TO COMBINE BUILDING INTO
SINGLE FIRE ALARM SYSTEM THAT WILL
EVACUATE THE ENTIRE BUILDING UPON
ALARM. ALTERNATIVELY CONTRACTOR

NOTE: ZONES ARE PROVIDED TO AID IN MAY OPT TO PROVIDE AN
. ENTRE BULDNG SHALL EVACUATE UPON ANNUNCIATOR PANEL IN LIEU OF A
\ FIRE ALARM CONTROL PANEL IN THIS LOCATION.

GENERAL NOTES:

\ZONE 1: EDUCATION
EDUCATION BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR ZONING PLAN /= .\ PROVIDE EQUIPMENT AND FSC INC
CONNECTIONS NECESSARY TO ENGINEERS, LLC.

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0" \
MAINTAIN ELEVATOR RECALL AND \-
SHUNT TRIP FUNCTIONS. 8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

NORTH

J

ANN [F]y, %

N
N

158,/

/.\_|

ENTRY
VESTIBULE OFFICE OFFICES

OFFICE

N N
@Ko (oK oDe]
STORAGE

E’q’\‘m STORAGE 15N
SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)

ey —
0 5 10 20

N
CANTEEN GIVE OUT STORAGE 3OD|E‘

o
15 ‘o’
BATHROOM > EE

N
BATHROOM 15 @& BATHROOM STORAGE

%N %N O TO LOWER LEVEL %N %N STORAGE OFFICE OF
= ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
DESIGN AND
b S sbe] (oKl CONSTRUCTION

E211

LINK
£213

N
" s DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
@

S VECHANICAL NwATE STORAGE Replace Fire Alarm Panels,

[ # ] .
HLET Multiple Assets

N @ £215 CLASSROOM CLASSROOM N @
/

e 15 [E218 ] Fe15

i X, WESTERN RECEPTION AND
DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL

CENTER

N % 15

N/

3064 3lo N ®
A m ® A

TOLET 8 CLASSROOM TOILET

£216 £217

N/
Fe. 15 sToraceE < 15

N N
-E225
%CORR\DOR

CORRIDOR
E214
(e
>
=z
ZaNd
R

CORRIDOR
[£226 |
=z
Ho &
CHASE
= =z
(9]

FORMS

i\

AN
7

(o))
o
z
/
o8
z

\3O/N
2 3401 FARAON ST.

ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

®
®
|

@ 15 CORRIDOR @ CORRIDOR 1

5 5 Z) Sl
- t= 2 PROJECT # (232501
: SITE # 7012

° & ® ASSET# 9327012063

CLASSROOM CLASSROOM :
N CLASSROOM N N @ N CLASSROOM N CLASSROOM

e a0 E K830 e K830

MECHANICAL

STUDY
{T_LD MAINTENANCE REVISION: 100% BID SET

BUILDING DATE: 05/14/2025

ILS | REVISION:
BUILDING DATE:

REVISION:

1 EDUCATION BUILDING - SECOND FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN @7 DATE:

SCALE: 3/32"=1-0" % CENTER ISSUE DATE:
GUILDING PARK

BUILDING

NORTH

CAD DWG FILE: FSC

DRAWN BY: DD/SS

CHECKED BY: JIMA

DESIGNED BY: FSC
LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING SHEET TITLE:

BUILDING
} LI rroremty EDUCATION BUILDING

BUILDING SECOND FLOOR
EDUCATION FlRE ALARM PLAN

BUILDING

SHEET NUMBER:
ADMIN

BUILDING FA'801

KEY PLAN 60 OF 61 SHEETS

05/13/2025




STATE OF MISSOURI

KEY NOTES FOR MIKE KEHOE,
PROPERTY BUILDING: GOVERNOR

@ LOCATION OF FACU. FACU SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO FIBER LOOP FOR
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY. EXISTING
FIRE ALARM SYSTEM IS FUNCTIONING
(HONEYWELL BY NOTIFIER);
COORDINATE WITH FACILITIES FOR
FIRE WATCH IF NECESSARY. EXISTING
PANEL IS TO BE REPLACED WITH A NEW
POTTER PANEL FOR CONSISTENCY
THROUGHOUT THE CAMPUS.

@ CEILING MOUNTED DEVICES MOUNTED
AS WALL MOUNTED DEVICES ON
STRUCTURE. DEVICES ARE TO BE
RELOCATED TO MEET MANUFACTURER
INSTALLATION AND NFPA 72
REQUIREMENTS.

GENERAL NOTES: FSC INC.

1. PROPERTY BUILDING IS NOT ENGINEERS, LLC
SPRINKLER PROTECTED. FIRE -

DETECTION IS TO BE PROVIDED 8675 W 96TH STREET
OVERLAND PARK, KS. 66212
THROUGHOUT. PHONE: 816.33.4373
FAX: 913.722.3484

J

(™)
Ne

RN
RN
o
A

=ze
Py
-,

CAGE
STORAGE
106EP

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" (IN FEET)
ey —
0 5 10 20

®

STORAGE OFFICE OF
108EP ADMINISTRATION
DIVISION OF FACILITIES
MANAGEMENT,
DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

RESTROOM

TO0EP @ Replace Fire Alarm Panels,
Multiple Assets

15 WESTERN RECEPTION AND
N R 110 DIAGNOSTIC CORRECTIONAL

/I\ @ @ Y @D CENTER

CORRIDOR 3401 FARAON ST.
TO02EF ST JOSEPH, MO 64506

NES
Py
-

RESTROOM
104LP PROJECT # (232501

® SITE # 7012

@ ASSET # 9327012063

BUILDING

DATE: 05/14/2025
@ 109EP LS REVISION:
JANITOR BUILDING DATE:

CLOSET @ N F @ :.i 15 @ REVISION:
T105EP FACU D CENTER ISSUE DATE:

GUILDING PARK
BUILDING

\N_/
15/0;| ® Q15 OFFICF Gi;}MA'NTENANCE REVISION: 100% BID SET

CAD DWG FILE: FSC

DRAWN BY: DD/SS

CHECKED BY: JIMA

DESIGNED BY: FSC
LAUNDRY

BUCHANAN Ej/ BUILDING SHEET TITLE:

BUILDING —————————— PROPERTY

STORAGE PROPERTY BUILDING
BUILDING FIRE ALARM PLAN

EDUCATION
BUILDING

1 PROPERTY STORAGE BUILDING - FIRST FLOOR FIRE ALARM PLAN /éz

SCALE: 1/8"=1-0" %

NORTH

SHEET NUMBER:
ADMIN

BUILDING FA'QOO

KEY PLAN 61 OF 61 SHEETS

05/13/2025




	Sheets and Views
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA-000
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA-001
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA-002
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA-003
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA-004
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA100
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA100-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA100-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA100-3
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA101
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA101-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA101-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA101-3
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA101-4
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA102
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA102-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA102-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA102-3
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA103-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA103-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA200-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA200-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA201-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA201-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA202-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA202-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA300-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA300-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA301-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA301-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA302-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA302-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA303-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA303-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA304-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA304-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA305-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA305-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA400
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA401
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA402
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA500
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA600
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA600-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA600-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA601
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA601-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA601-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA602
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA602-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA602-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA603
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA603-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA603-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA604
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA604-1
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA604-2
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA700
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA800
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA801
	FA_WesternCorrectionalCentralFireAlarm-FA900


